O JFH® 230n-2

(FPORDT AN B3V dRBONNER BOWORAL FOeOs a0 c03)
3 005e300, DI0T:14:3¢ FW,,0W0° 2020

30335: 77

SFrOE TOODEEIE, ROADLOD 355300 NE Be0a3od WO

BT903:31.07.2020, 14.08.2020, 28.08.2020 doorise 28.08.2020 303 BRTRATI
30T RN DI, 2eded W3V TOSHIINY (BOOEET TN
995630, 2020 (BT EdT 975050363 B0835-15) TIEEIT Tazes 2e0ey AL3NY
(Foe3ez DB [EPBOH AW,0DOH BNOFIH Q0H0Zie (VTAIRPPARSI )
90050363, 2020 (FT0F e e9059503¢3 KO85 -19) FOOE 3T Tozss 2edey® AAPINY
(32038 DFED [LRBOH A,0ROD NOF D QoD0ZER) (VTARSRLPLAES)
e0sCeS, 2020 (BOoEEdT e9Rs 8 mOBs-20)0 BINF T,
https://erajyapatra. karnataka.gov.in/ S, G DS BORIS
e903BDED JOLD www.kla.kar.nic.in/council/council.htm D)

REBRBLITITONG D0 B eDRLT 3PONBRRIONG.

F.e30°%. aDTOT,
TOORNFTIAE

Iem BRI e, BoRFCNIR.

www.kla.kar.nic.in/council!council.htm



DFea v, BB

won - ¥ gonuath, SHdhsrer 9, oniy , 9090  PPEHS, L. JEF, OFVI) S0. 884
Part - IV Bengaturu, FRIDAY,28, AUGUST ,2020( BHADRAPADA, 6, ShakaVarsha,1942) Mo, 373

RoxBeodh Symodne shd), wors 9w’ BWaTOoDh
oD UR
Hof; Homzan 50 peas 2020, Won¥sds, DIDOE: 28.08.2020
TP ER

BIOEIE Doty AedeF AAESNY (F003T IFed HWBOH Aed, 000N IS
QOH0Fee) (ITRINELEI) LIER;TXF, 2020 BTIT, 20200 MR, S0Te 28:3¢ RV0TIOLH
Co2esToO0 2,1 BRCT,, AOsows SSLaPFMmN [uIy, 2020 U BoosddT eapeits
RORBs: 20 OWITON FRREEST Uozss BIWC), FTeIRTOD est3DREIONS.

2020 ¢ Fo0Fédw eorraaitgxoals 20

B Fsdd Do Jeder Besdrie (T00d® DEee BeBod Aw,ohod Brerudg
Sohodee) (AVITeITH) eouied, 2020

2503 Tiea002:5%3 &, BT SBEEE), BOOFEIT Dotusaso0D0n @aiosddasan 20200
eI, 2B DIDOTIIOR) Tordds Tozss F A F0WBTONE), BT BTN

BODEEIE Totss ReI® AHNE (30037 3FL BLRBOH AW,0D0D PR AT TIN5
QoDHOIEs) LaRDOPED, 20128y, (20130 FTREENT e3ED0NED 12) QBRTRAFEL) 2O
(SIADRA e _

Cgooredd  Jpesay  ebdE),  BRordd  oJped  m0WE, eaDRIITIEY,

QI DHIEDOT DB, BE), W), TDIOT FO@TE NELINLMON IR TT,
ToRdRe), Iy FEHTR,  SNCITRRDIIE AT RN h Lol MEENIAFOVDINARZE
eNOEDNEIONOTR TRIEE)T siard; Uo2ssa0DN T3, NTIeYTOOT:

SEOOE BN, LT3 R0IRNE 2137 e EE (N DOBWEW  eDRLT
BEFFIR e9DFICT, FLUONNA BROEEITES Dotusm@owd) € 3OS &ér;yoﬁcit’za‘rﬁaioa_

T AT, DCWT:-
()



eidne (SO0IT 33nm qej‘as)ojo r.aaauof:)o& o"‘iT‘T%)FEuﬁﬁ SCHOBED)
(ci)ﬁﬁ?dﬁ_@e;?m 3) 9505, 2020 OTR REOD BTN

(2) B> & 2 predt 220N WTBT .

2. JdzEs thd ) oy )BT RRetlT TR g er ANy
ENSORUOWN R:asz_p&c& :Smr”e:’nfé Nlewlexchx) oo ORED, 20120, @0
ehHchEh 12) 5 EVPOT QTR L ST

- | aal = — b i
() Aypd e9Esn Wl 35001 BROLLION
— e —d o e, — el o -"D_.:I e | [ S | e — -, 3, e —t
Srrseiots R Spcadcen «aé.,e, 35oetit ToCF & BT E RO 2SR 3T
@E;:»;E/

() TN STRBWIT OdsREd T TRV IOV CANY es 0323 REIDTI, ST FINE LT
BoReBTS O35REHTI BB B TI0, AT AT RCIATAL B TR DT O, 230 DRITHEL,
5 (LA

(%) N RS AATIA O30sHER @m{’)odaa;bm; T, 3500300 O30eHTK
T MOLIAL 30220DRABOE, ROy OIeEdT 0T, T8ROI estieve BFONTn
PATIATICGANASR (SIAIAE

(T) ke BePTIOT O35 TV BT TOT, 2300353, & = PEMT, BOB,
iy ARt eTHese %R B HOWORA T G INEY TR L ERTR R
éﬁ@&?‘dﬁﬁ"*@@i}ﬁ:ﬂ?{b& IO TR BT ERANCAN ATVEIRRORIT T A TANAN
esONEBOADED Seret @mel eon FOANEIN Y EG 11 {SNWIATY FRRL ::5{‘*&«“‘{ TSIV
eITIEID EuelesTIeN D EATISAYSHIGY STBRT, @ :iwocjaaiﬁnmmm eoT3Es0 R0 F0EITD
TH3), OB st BOG, 202630, ete0 LTI B% oD, EYRIVEITD.

3 BUTDONTIDLD
SoFETR ORI

BIOFE O TAR IO \ﬁwqﬁsmd AN
@f‘(r‘l bt

Cmdt thvu '

(3. T30, BTVOT’ 2303}

BwaFr G FoODFTIDE
T R i "(W‘\Hﬂ‘@s’\ medn s T
\‘\!‘\Jl’ }\J\J\\-.r'\d Wb\. FLS ] LA ‘LJJ VUF\J\\J

CeFS B 5985,



3

PARLIAMENTARY AFFAIRS AND LEGISLATION SECRETARIAT

NOTIFICATION

No.: DPAL 50 SHASANA 2020, BENGALURY, DATED: 28.08.2020

Ordered that the translation of FOoFed® Tasss Rede¥ RN (32087 dFeo
BERA0H A2,0DCH BMFSEB DOD0ZE) (VTRITRPRIE) 39,03, 2020 (2020
3 Baerddd 9505038 F04a3s: 20) in English language, be published as authorized
by the Governor of Karnataka under clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution
of India in the Karnataka Gazette for general information.

The following translation of Karnataka Rajya Civil Sevegala (Tantrika
Shikshana Elakeya Sibbandiya Vargavane Niyantrana) (Nirasanagolisuva)
Adhyadesha, 2020 (2020 ra Karnataka Adhyadesha sankhye: 20 } in English
language is published in the Official Gazette as authorized by the Governor of
Karnataka under clause (3} of Article 348 of the Constitution of India.

KARNATAKA ORDINANCE NO. 20 OF 2020
THE KARNATAKA STATE CIVIL SERVICES (REGULATION OF TRANSFER COF STAFF

OF DEPARTMENT OF TECHNICAL EDUCATION} (REPEAL) ORDINANCE, 2020

(Promulgated by the Governor of Karnataka in the Seventy first year of the
Republic of India and First published in the Karnataka Gazette Extra-ordinary on
the 28t day of August, 2020)

An Ordinance to repeal the Karnataka State Civil Services (Regulation of
transfer of staff of Department of Technical Education) Act, 2012 {Karnataka Act
12 of 2013);

Whereas the Karnataka Legislative Assembly and the Karnataka Legislative
Council are not in session and the Governor of Karnataka is satisfied that the
circumstances exist which render it necessary for him to take immediate action to

promulgate the Ordinance for the purposes hereinafter appearing;

Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by clause (1) of Article
213 of the Constitution of India, the Governor of Karnataka is pleased to
promulgate the following Ordinance, namely:-

1. Short title and commencement.- (1) This Ordinance may be called the
Karnataka State Civil Services (Regulation of transfer of staff of Department of
Technical Education) (Repeal) Ordinance, 2020.

(2) It shall come into force at once.



ﬁﬁiiﬂﬁ&aﬂu}iﬁ@iﬁﬁ “POSTAL REGH. o RAPIKBOSIZ0I01T19 ' ‘||

| Liconsed i uost without prepaymant WP Mo. 287 1
|

e T ..._.-_._.._.._.._.__.....u—.._.,._-..._-_.._. e .__._.--.._..-_.__.._...—...._._-._.__,._..,_._.._,._.,_.._.__..._..._.._-_._

2, Repeal and savings. The Karnataka State Civil 3 rvices {Regulati&m of

transier of staff of Devartment of Technical Education) Act, 2012 (Kamataka Act
19 of 2013) 18 hereby repealed: ‘
provided. that, such repeal shall not affect,

(a) the previous pperation of the Act 30 repealed of anything duly done 0f
suflfered thereuadier; 6F

(b) any right, privilege, obligation OF Loty acquired, accrued Of incurred
s A Bt 5 PR, P e T
uuuC_ Liri &bl SR b e bANT i, Al

{c) an nenalty forfeiture, 61 punishment iqourred in T€S ect of any offence
{ % }-‘ J 3 7 ¥ .
T

red under the Act 80 repealed; OF

(@) any investigation, jegal proceeding, oF cemedy in respect of any such
right, privilege, obligation, liability, penalty; forfeiture or punis’nment as aforesaid;
and any such investigation, legal pmceedings or remedy may be instituted,
continued of enforced and any such penally, forfeiture and punishment may be
imposed, as if this Ordinance had not been passed.

"The above transiation of BarerédT TS 23 er AeINY (00 Bg
gespaiod 23,0000 PANCIE AcHoE o) {:&tﬁﬁﬁﬁ@@maﬁ) estTR T30S, 2020

(20200 NI AL 097305C3¢ S w0l 20 be published in the Official Gazette under

clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution of India.

VAJUBHAIL VALA
SOVERNOR OF BKARN ATAKA

By order and in the name of the
Governor of Karnataka,

(K. DW&MMATH BABU)

Secretary 10 Government )
Department O Parliamentary Affairs

and Legislation.

A R



@@%@mﬁ f‘c_.@%mgmzﬁmb

DFeR oo, BB

mn-9

Part— 1V Bengaluru, FRIDAY, 28, AUGYST, 202¢( BHADRAPADA, 6, ShakaVarsha,1942)

gdonideth, By¥eIad o, wi , 2090 PTTT, k. TINHF, OFV)

0. a8
MNo. 372

Bordeod ssdmavned sbE), voax 0w Jumeocd

Bosl;: Rosi;pow 49 Tais 2020, Won¥ed, DEwod: 28.08.2020

ODBLOWR

TOOEEIT Totsy Aeder AABNY (Toedten dgce weoliod Az,000h o
DODOFER) (WTAIRALRIT) 9 rdtd, 2020 Qu3s, 20200 &nia, Soney 28 ¢
DOROTTOLN Tessa3000 2Wad,i WRTSTI, Avedwdls J%e3PTneon |8y, 2020 ©
TOIFEIT LS ROBs19 QOWITRN FIIEET Todss BIBE), WyFe3xe3eFord

e33ed RN,

2020 G 3008w oo nity Koals: 19

FRordd¥ o AeX BeaSne (T3t B weolad Aw,0D0dh BreFRs

woboHe0) (DURIRLPANTE) ety 2020

(23003 Neateesl OR,BROTN BREEY), Boordld DazssmooD0l &) 3daon
20200 eon=g, 28:3¢ DRW0T BOR) TooFRT DozsEIE QTR R0BFONE) SATEN

TN AATATAY)

TOOFEST Todss Aeder HRNY (Toekzd 3Feo BeRBOD AW,000D @roramd
QODOZED) SIDAORED, 20123, (20130 FIRNEET e9DICHRD 12) ABHIReP=en

20T LS.
 Berdds

JPITRG  ENF), TOoERT el BORIE),

LTI

B8 DEYHTIVOT &DB), B, IR, B0 FORHE N LBROTON eaprLIeTeda,
DAL, Y FEHeESR, IRNZARE  OBFRePRBOT  JusEenried

e0E30NI0HOTI) FIVFEIT eI TRz ehadtdésa, N SDots;

BSTOOE N, 908 HOeIPOTT 213336 esed a3t (N3 0oL dheos

B3 E  DTITVWI, FOIONA  ToordFT Dazgmoedd
LRI TeI), BjaiasDATRL, ot

(@)

& ESNobha



o
o
i —— e by S U
wnal JE, D FE - 2 natan oF P, o PR o A
] 3 Fo N .. 7 o e
1. Bodw wRL hgy wgterw- U 25 09It ¥ aEsdE Uk AelS
o = [y ¥ @ at, 23
e U R i G omn Ju el ameen e T L Th 1 = B

- - =N P P P T L K L S L
THCIwal AN Nwa}uww Tt I G U AN Lot Wi M)

it T . VUL T s gy pmmns 9 Oy o =R g T By
, SaREd E, ¢t Saddrinh - TOUFWY Totsg eIty 2er3nef (FReKE) IFES

PATRDDMOW 22,0000 FIRETHRD AOPOTER) e9E 03, 201253, (20130 BrddE
IO 06) B BT RPN

RO, 90T SoRTed.-

(&) oot JORRRROTS I eDACENTS LT 00383 TS BTN
SIBERT T AT T 7 1 ¢ JATRIAN O330eHTH FOODFW RIS
2350DR BT ea3EI0

(@) en ST FeI B0 £ D ORBITS SNOR eIBERVT, EATICATADI

SIAAL 3R T R T A fTOU, ARG IRCIATAD B HBRDTONR,

2 ODR BT

(=

(SIAIAD

(2 @Rl AoARTeI ATV ga&:&a‘baﬁ:ﬁ«:ﬁ G, RRBLERT RaTHTX
OTTILIB, ﬁowo@%@oﬁ. ABOSRTS CITRTHTX Hot3, e eten eoryaze DO
23DRBTL. SSLATAD,

(@) a3 BePBOT Rsa3e T, S fTes, 239G3, B pHrdd, BOR.
e, ReLe) IR 28R F0WORATS o3eadtit 38, R sl ETATAD
aﬁ@mdmmoﬁmﬁaﬂa& PR AT TR DR FAVICH] AGRBARPRIT AT SLCSTAINNN
ca0NeBORADTI 2o 2t TR 8900 33959638 BA50PT TR 3,3BOBOHTI
DIATAD. Eﬁ@ﬁo@fﬁféﬁmﬁ)ﬁ?\ﬁ:)& JERTIT, ‘«;b:aor:iaaﬁrﬁﬁzwimo eATIET 200

—

STHTITII THIB, 90 cTRedT TIOTR, 530080 et S TATAL, HY Oy OEYRITOICIV.

i HLIDCNTIVLID
N L AL O LT ADLDISA

FTOEET AR £9279, FIRO0 EANESY
w530 IBADREL,

(#. oo LR 23R}
O TOONFTOE
ZoRERTD PARAesOSIALY 3, TOAD
BoES a8,



a

PARLIAMIENTARY AFFAIRS AND LEGISLATION SECRETARIAY
NOTIFICATION
No.. DPAL 49 SHASANA 2020, BENGALURU, DATED:; 28.08.2020

Ordered that the translation of FREEIT Totss Jeder AeINS (Faede dFeo
3598303 22,0003 SMFEdts DOR0ZEs) (NBRIRPPRIES) 25305T3¢d, 2020 {2020
O 00T 590308 Aoy 19) in English language, be published as authorized
by the Governor of Karnataka under clause (3) of Article 348 of the Constitution
of India in the Karnataka Gazette for general information.

The following translation of Karnataka Rajya Civil Sevegala (Kaleju
Shikshana FElakeya Sibbandiya Vargavane Niyantrana) (Nirasanagolisuva)
Adhyadesha, 2020 (2020 ra Karnataka Adhyadesha sankhye:19) in English
language is published in the Official Gazette as authorized by the Governor of
Karnataka under clause {3) of Article 348 of the Constitution of India.

KARNATAKA ORDINANCE NO. 19 OF 2020
THE KARNATAKA STATE CIVIL SERVICE (REGULATION OF TRANSFER OF
STAFF OF DEPARTMENT OF COLLEGIATE EDUCATION} (REPEAL)
ORDINANCE, 2020

(Promulgated by the Governor of Karnataka in the Seventy first year of the
Republic of India and First published in the Karnataka Gazette Extra-ordinary on
the 28" day of August, 2020) \

An Ordinance to repeal the Karnataka State Civil Services (Regulation of

transfer of staff of Department of Collegiate Education) Act, 2012 (Karnataka Act
06 of 2013},

Whereas the Karnataka Legislative Assembly and the Karnataka Legislative
Council are not in session and the Governor of Karnataka is satisfied that the

circumstances exist which render it necessary for him to take immediate action to

- promulgate the Ordinance for the purposes hereinafter appearing;

Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by clause (1) of Article
213 of the Constitution of India, the Governor of Karnataka is pleased to

promulgate the following Ordinance, namely:-

1. Short title and commencement.- (1} This Ordinance may be called the
Karnataka State Civil Services {Regulation of transfer of staff of Department of
Collegiate Education) (Repeal) Ordinance, 2020.

{2) it shall come into force at once.



FR.H.E. Ho, LARBH 20V 167147 PLSTAL ".EGN,!“.a."“':‘.“.L’Z‘.FEGS.’.'-’,'_-‘.{“’?“"?-“E ll

Wl g SR AN H=FARg ]

:

- . Lon . . o i Py —
l Licensed ko postwithout prepayiment WP Mo, 287 et
L ) :
e e Rt i — "

ﬁ'{ r ]
__.__..._——--—-——"'—“..—--—__,...—-—-_....—.\.._m—m — _-—-m-—u-.—-...—-...—-.__..—--.__-._-.—-—_..——--—_.-—-,_-.—--—h-_u-.-—..,—._—-—-__—-._.——-.._u ——— e’ ']
oramai and cavings.- The Karnataks Stat it Qervices [(Regy jation of
-y &lmwr!‘mﬁ ey Frt ¥ O A AR AN e A, AA LRA A T R R, B g A hA g A \‘ - bv\a.-w- A s
TR LI P 7 o R W e T it i ey s By Aot OOVTT (17 o im nAm e Tr e Aot
LLcAk bRk W3 LEALL WAL J_J\,,j:}('.u. LLLAMALLL WL S LU e REL LA LAvALE O F L L] LAty AN R Lt FARAGLLALREL L hYoL

06 of 2013} is hereby repeated:

Provided that; such repeal shall not affect,-

() the previous operation of she Act so repealed oF anything du

By

suffered thereunder; or

{b) any right, privilege, obligation or liability acquired, accrued or incurred
under the Act, 80 repealed; of

(c) any penalty, forfeiture, of punishment incurred in respect of any offence

" . —— SR - e = T o T,
commnted LGS the Actaso e Pr,a sy O

(d) any investigation, legal proceeding, oF ~emedy in respect of any such
right, privilege. obligation, liability, penalty, forfeiture or punishment as aforesaid;
and any such investigation, legal proceedings O remedy may be instituted,
continued or enforced and any such penaity, forfeiture and punishment may be
imposed, as if this Ordinance had not been passed.

The above translation of BRIBE 88 T N Bedne (o3 wd dyee
gersdobRw,ocRob Seeas Joboses) (Do PR extyeUicH, 2020

(20205 BODEET IR IORS moads 19 be published in the Official Gazette under
clause (3} of Article 348 of the Constitution of India.

VAJUBHAL VALA
GOYVERNOR OF KARNATAKA

By order and in the name of the
CYovernor of Karnataka,

{3 DWARAKRANATH BABU}
Secretary 10 _}’:‘xovemmeni: o
Department of 1Pars.1amentary Affairs

oG LacE

Loy

B
TS LA L L.

SR SR b e ,__._,._.,_._._._.__._._,...__.,_..._._.._...._...,_....__._-.__... —— it e

Qg Berie HpoeEci- Som s, BRereE UREE. Soard o) Budpreeod. Ioridash-et.

il GRAGE TN LA



7.
P Rl

w@%ﬁmﬁ THLIBoVTDTD.
ATeR ToR D33

) D=
BT,

EATTE Bonath, BBTIT 40, wd, J090( T, €, BISLE OFPI) Jo. 890
Part— IVA Bengaluru, FRIDAY,31,JULY, 282@( Shravana,9, ShakaVarsha 1942) -Nea. 320

PARLIAMENTARY AFFAIRS AND LEGISLATION éECRETARIAT
NOTIFICATION

NO. SAMVYASHAE 27 SHASANA 2020, BENGALURU, dated: 31.07.2020

The Industrial Disputes and certain other Laws {Karnataka Amendment)
Ordinance, 2020 <ug =g 3Jone 318 OTOTIOT Doz EROT wff BRBes), W,

$0TeFRN FTH, 20200 TIFLT woRGes "odd: 15 H0RTeN FIFWT TRuIIRG mEMTdeion:

)
(StnldrdanTatnl
KARNATAKA ORDINANCE NO. 15 OF 2020

THE INDUSTRIAL DISPUTES AND CERTAIN OTHER LAWS (KARNATAKA
AMENDMENT} ORDINANCE, 2020.

(Promulgated by the Governor of Karnataka in the Seventy-first year of the
Republic of India and first published in the Karnataka Gazette Extra-Ordinary on
31st day of July, 2020)

An Ordinance further to amend the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947, the
Factories Act, 1948 and the Contract Labour (Regulation and Abolition) Act, 1970
to provide measures to hoost easy of doing business in the State of Karnataka.

Whereas it is expedient to provide measures to boost ease of doing business
in the State of Karnataka and for the matters connected therewith or incidental
thereto;

Whereas previous instructions of the President of India vide Order
No:14/07/2020-Judl..& PP, dated:11.07.2020 has been obtained in this regard
as required under the proviso to clause (1) of Article 213 of the Constitution.

Whereas the Karnataka State Legislative Assembly and the Karnataka
Legislative Council are not in session and the Governor of Karnataka is satisfied
that the circumstances exist which render it necessary for him to take immediate
action to promulgate the Ordinance for the purposes hereinafter appearing;

(®)



ﬂ a4

213 of the Constitution of India, the Governor of Karnataka is pleased to
promulgate the following Ordinance, namely:-

1. Short title and commencement.-(1) This Ordinance may be called
the Industrial Disputes and Certain other laws (Karnataka Amendment)
Ordinance, 2020.

(2) 1t shall come into force at once.

2. Amendment of the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947.- In the
Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 (Central Act No.14 of 1947), in section 25K,-

{i) in sub-section (1), for the words "one hundred’, the words "three
hundred”, shall be substituted; and
(ii) in sub-section (1A), for the words "one hundred", the words "three
hundred", shall be substituted.
3. Amendment of the Factories Act, 1948.- In the Factories Act, 1948
(Central Act No.63 of 1948),- |
(1)  in section 2, in clause (m),-
(i) in item (i) for the words "ten or more", the words "twenty or more”,
shall be substituted; and
{ii) in item (ii), for the words "twenty or more", the words "forty or more’,
shall be substituted.
(2) in section 65, in sub section (3) in clause {iv) for the words
“seventy five” the words “one hundred and twenty five” shall be substituted.
4. Amendment of the Contract Labour (Regulation and Abolition)
Act, 1970.- In the Contract Labour (Regulation and Abolition) Act, 1970 (Central
Act No.47 of 1970), in section 1, in sub-section (4) in item (a) for the words
"twenty or more", the words "fifty or more”, shall be substituted.

VAJUBHAI VALA
GOVERNOR OF KARNATAKA

By Order and in the name of the

Governor of Karnataka,

(K.DWARAKANATH BABU)

Secretary to Government

Department of Parliamentary Affairs and
Legislation

® r

Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by clause (1) of Article-



a2

Hokheoh dézdmdﬁm &) 73 UuN dulaeoah
epBeEs

350355: aioaézrm 27 73R 2020, WJonidad, Hoeod: 31.07.2020

Ordered that the translation of the Industrial Disputes and certain other
Laws (Karnataka Amendment) Ordinance, 2020 (Karnataka Ordinance 15 of
2020) in Kannada language, be published as authorized by the Governor of
Karnataka under section S5A of the Karnataka Official Language Act, 1963 in the
Karnataka Gazette for general information.

The following translation of the Industrial Disputes and certain other
Laws (Karnataka Amendment} Ordinance, 2020 (Karnataka Ordinance 15 of
2020) in Kannada language is. published in the Official Gazette under the
authority of the Governor of Karnataka under section 5A of the Karnataka Official
Language Act, 1963.

20200 soore3s esc,mécje*d FGOQ% 15
8,05 Jdzednw @) 30 930 sodexbrd (Buerid 3[B) eﬂc;médw, 2020

(@03 Meoed ondRode IRFBY BIrwd Tor@Vdod T ddueid Dd)

20200 @uedy 31 DT08B0MD BeFud JFa Tk B3wY Setn BBurenNd).

BRFIB 0230 B B0 SEDPYTY, ricbrievey nBeldDITE, BV,
VBVODWP TSN B0z JTTNY wBJLED, 1947, TSNy BJALE, 1948
D) AR HDeEY (AoboBer DB SQed) wBAADD, 1970) DB, DB
T 2ot WLy Tes,

BIeFwd 0B S @S0 JIBDPBF, Dridbriedtey  euBedIYcy, DI
©wdd, ToworEl Tie GRI@ONSDE  J@ebnerel FaEbriva susBwoRVHD
01»§a‘aﬁd3@c3605;

272038 TBodmeIE 2133e wrbefend (1)Se 2080 BToBd vld) NI EddTed

D03 03l Cv@m GEC Fpsr AeUSnYh eded So: 14/07/2020-30nBo0¢ & S,

BT208: 11.07.20200 Dwws B3BBG,



&

BarIs AFORRY DB rerwd S BOFR wBBBIBO WBDIHBOT DR @Q‘:\.
@Ry, 2o Borhuha WueBromn VryEIRy, BaydTD. Bem) TRy, BRDERRB
wdﬁér{m@mdotﬁ adéairmmb guotTNSodotd Baereidd aﬂmaiﬁ oaaséamut‘)ﬁ
SRR ADDBOT;
oil, 2903 FoJTRT 2137 @rdoe.gedd () 2038 Swws BBBTT CIATSpleIaTs)
| 23eradhd BuertiBs g @D S Jwod3 eﬂc_maslcfcéaiaigt Za T8, Q0BT:~
1. Bogs BV DR @YV .- (1) B LTI, 8 1050 dadrish BB B0
@30 BRAINY (Berud SWBA) W Ked, 2020 0T BB, D).
(2) @D B Berde 0 WIBER.
2. 8@386& ATEnY B, 19478 3@)5&.- 8;)'(\:)66? ANy dabD,
19473 (19470 BeoB; 9B D0. 14) 258 c‘ajﬁdea.dgr
() (NBe VBB,BTRTY “wotd Sty oow BEAIR Bwed SR oo BTNV,
B303peRTIB,R; DR
(i) (10) BVBBBVRBY wol IRy 0 BER9R Bwed Jed dow BT,
330deedaBB,.
3. ZYVIERINY wDJabed, 19488 SS8.- SoarRNY DA, 1948080 (19480
Beor,; AohE Jo. 63).-
(1) 253¢ B30T (0) WOBRA,-
() () RO "Ba) edm B eow FENEN BB edsy BT

SERVAY, B30T B



e
_’,-":_No. KARBIL/2001/47147 POSTAL REGN. No, RNPIKA/BGS(2202/2017-19
ﬁyxﬁensed to post without prepayment VWPP No. 297

5]

'~ (i) (if=e 23WARO 2B 3) FTe BIF" S0 IVALT VOSTD OFT? @ oow
BERYRY, &3l IBET).

(2) eéa?e 38008 (3)Se  wLBBICHREOR (Ve 2oBRY oD B oo IR
WO ARUD @%@d}" 20 BENYRY, F30leedJTZ Q).

4. AR BacbFET (dabod)t DR S&alred) eBdabad, 19700 3daB.- rHEn
FocF30 (AoboB e A 3BRE) BhAb, 197089 (19?0(5.\880@ eaBdohzdh rdo a47)
15e BB00T (4)Fe BBICHEOT (0) WRNITO AT H eﬂc;g‘)la‘a BYR" Qo DTNYT

RBOBR) OTTe B D00 BENYRY, BITBBR).

The above translation of the Industrial Disputes and Certain other laws
(Karnataka Amendment) Ordinance, 2020 (Karnataka Ordinance 15 of 2020) shall be

authoritative text in the Kannada language under section 5-A of the Karnataka Official
Language Act, 1963 {Karnataka Act 26 of 1963).
A EATADL VA DI P

BRI LIBD U‘a&ﬂémod)

BT3B cma%mud ese T anloe0

B 630 BIORO

(8. 9,080 wow)
.pidelnl plesiigntita
SoRBeod SBHITH D)
2o T3 weed

s Barie Bdet- Koduanbmbiw. dTers owyRE,. Joerd Seor Fugeeuad, Wonvsds

SLINL GARDE e P e ol




DHTITRN WD
AFed Toz, BB

W -9 Zontatd, HFWT , OV, SNT, 5050 { TFre 54, IFTUF, OFP.D) Jo. a2
Part - IVA Bengaluru, FRIDAY, 14, AUGUST, 2620 ( Shravana , 23, ShakaVarsha,1942) No. 347

PARLIAMENTARY AFFAIRS AND LEGISLATION SECRETARIAT
NOTIFICATION

NO. SAMVYASHAE 27 SHASANA 2020, BENGALURU, dated: 14.08.2020

The Industrial Disputes and certain other Laws (Karnataka Amendment)
Ordinance, 2020 %1%, IOWORAW SBRLSR 20200 esnixy, Sony 12:3¢
DTOTEOW) Vasaowl wd,i BeGr, oo 3eHs3PEmn /I,
TOOFEIT U2 BI T, 3R eITO est3ed=erones.

CORRIGENDUM

Subject: The Industrial Disputes and certain other Laws (Karnataka
Amendment) Ordinance, 2020 (Karnataka Ordinance No.15
of 2020)

Reference: Notification No. SAMVYASHAE 27 SHASANA 2020,
dated 315T JULY, 2020 published in Part IV of the
Karnataka Gazette Extraordinary No.320, dated: 31.07.2020.

Fhkhk

In the Industrial Disputes and certain other Laws (Karnataka Amendment)
Ordinance, 2020 (Karnataka Ordinance No.15 of 2020) published in Notification
No. SAMVYASHAE 27 SHASANA 2020, dated 3157 JULY, 2020 published in Part
IV of the Karnataka Gazette Extraordinary No.320, dated: 31.07.2020 the
following corrections shall be read with effect from 31.07.2020, in 5t page, in 8%
line, for 'VOTI, eagdemo B23,1" read, "205338), 9eId B3,

By Order and in the name of the
Governor of Karnataka

(K.DWARAKANATH BABU)
Secretary to Government
Department of Parliamentary Affairs

and Legislation
™



RN No.KARBIL/2001/47147 POSTAL REGN. No. RNPIKA/BGS/2202{2017-19
Licensed to post without prepayment WPP No. 297

2

JoRBeod HeT/ONYD 3, TR 0233 B3P0
DT RIS

2L

083;: Boxwoy 27 ZoAd 2020, S[onvev, BDIwow: 14.08.2020

The Industrial Disputes and certain other Laws (Karnataka Amendment)
Ordinance, 2020 &3F, S0WODAT  3WRLAH 20203 e3nAe, Sone 12X
ATOOBEORY  To%sweT w3 BRTVBIW,, T30 ITPTMON BT
2TorE}s Dot BITE), WTEIRLHTOTD 303 HRIDNG.

3BeLe3

DROR: FyTODTD JeIVTINF 23, BO) BIT FOIRINY (ToeedT
33, 330s) e9st3, 2020 (20200 FU0F ST 9030503 RO5:15)
eue3£a); BIREEIT I Cotssid3) A0 320, DID0T: 31 07.20200 2321
V3 BT ODRAW R0 RO 27 FoRS 2020
OT0F: 313¢ 2ae3, 2020
2oreld OBeR OowsRg AO0Bs 320, AP0 31.07.20208 gert OO,
S BEIACT ODRPWS B0y ROW;P%H 27 JOR 2020 B T00T: 313 203, 20203€),
BBRIBRRORB  FYDTD JeEneh Hd, IOy B30 FORPNY  (FTELD
3B 9IeTNT, 20200¢). (20208 TRt 903050k R0835.15) AV OIAIN
AT BRNAFT, 31.07.2020003 27201 WBE0I 5 EBAYITE,. S RDET 83
HOTE), VORI, P B3, B” OTDEITV, "R, ©FPTe BW,T”
02N LDFRY,IT,T,.

2393 TateseOT €525, S0FeT
03, L9530 BROSLD,,

(¥.050, 0% To5* W)

BEE O TOONETIE
SORDEOD 53553500 NP EDIYTOA D
333 aeeds.

Sugpd Barie &zoBsi- SoBUTBEb, Brerlad UaRES, RErd deod, dutymevcd. Jorived

SUNIL GARDE ol



