STELE TR K23
samgﬁc Plapty il
samqpc Dlab{¢=1

TOOF T S00RN PrEeod :o‘oﬂ@rieé (SWpIR) DFdecws, 2017
(20178 QgeSTPoR Jgeohs 30336—24)

BDOFE3F OoRN dcﬁ&eoﬁa XoR mﬁ VRIODIW, 2007, DI, SHTB BRBPHTTN
WOTD DTEONT.

BY  ARFO0T  FOBWWMB  WBEINTMON  FIoFs  OFN  FTseod  FoFnS
VOO, 2007, (20078 IToFwF ORICDT  21) DIT STIB mz:sb@da
OV TNTRTOOT;

9 ZPTZ NI womdoude IRFBY  Foor s Tow, DPOIIOBOHOT T4
FOODT0Z LHOACHNZeND:~

I Bo3® BRh DI /PO~ (1) B8 VOIODIDID, FIFLT RN F;TBe0D
oi@ﬁ (émw@) @azsosm 2017 20T IBODITI.

(2) B3 83 3RSt 2OR WIBIWY,

2. 23¢ T[EONE SWIR.- FIFLT VAN ﬁddéﬁeoja :303@71@;3 0N, 20070
(20078 3JpFe38 ©RICHD 21) (VY AWMFTOOT RO LHICNT[OW Y EeDITONT)
28¢ TITRTY,~

(1) (8) DOBT e B3 BWHOOFTB, KOBBZY, OTT -

“(a-1) "By oGm0 DT[NT BDONENRTE JOTT BWE” H0TT, 83¢
THoRE WBONY THEI0INE VYUY OT@0 DJIOINT  DOWNBERTE  [OTT
DeNd&”

(il) (22F) DOBE, B3 WHOOITI, BECIRCBRIZT), OWT :—
(@wF) “modewm BWE” Q0TW3, T TITRT  ©B0DY  TwWS030T
TOSCOTO TNS;”;

(ili) (@) DOBRY “BRZRTT IIZNII,” 0w TWNE oD "I To
RTFTy) FOTOY ea@mazsfouaamd BeZoD o3RPTe 9T ammm”
D0 BINI, ie@ﬁé%&d%;



(V) (257) DOBT Iam0H 8 SNODTTR, ACORTEW), OTT:~
“(@0-1) “doenod AITH I LRN B@eoh FOANY I 20T,
ODRPBODY &@F%ﬁ@?&’@?d dwen daa’_oo ooRN dédzs%eo:b h’oz);ﬁ@é Sﬁ%ﬁﬁﬁo
DB BREBMOOBR;”

(V) (2T°) DOBTY,-

() “TIFT,” TET DB VOITHR BT IToeD 7, BoWS AT
D0 BoRS” WIEIT” D0V TWNTI, YOITER W¥H,0300N :o’ebxé'@d%;
O

(D) “o3pRBE JTOJOT FTORWIETOT" Q02 JTWNPN &SRB,
ooz, ATOFTR), VRIAWIOD WAVT, WHIRBIWIDOWT,” D08 TWII,
VORI WH300N FeORITIY.

(Vi) (807) DOBH ITHe00H Bt BPODITY, NeOTIZT), DOTT:~
“(@F) “oDRRW” 08T, B VPICNTE ONTT WDILA.”

3. 33¢ TEORT ITIR.~ DRV VRIODIT 33e TFTHT JITORITY  "WwdF oI,
@*fdssﬁcb” DO JTNG BTT0N “Tond emo.—u’wocjm?sagl @33:36:33'0;6%” 08) mmm‘i

4. 43¢ TEFONTW FIRREEN.—  DRO ORICHWT 43¢ TFTE T BNOOITR,
BB03ReBITTIW), DOTWT:~

“4. Bpcomtd PTS.~ TIIROD BPODNY B WNODTITZ, &¥RR0B Spcorrd
TWOTTH) ATIZR, QOTT:-

) BH0D BIROTO @c%ﬁdo
b R e.-sziraerﬁZS W) BENOW FLRED WOTWO RTF, TODFTHF
2 B SOINT ©HTO ;353:35

a OB ID TOVVBFTT  wRT, BT dédééeoda DD | FBAD
Q3T ﬁédé&eoda w%mm& BB mséé T3
[OFHOT %z&gpo ;‘)d:dédo

5. 58%¢ Jonm IR~ RO ORICHIDT 5T ToeRY o),

x@ﬁxa-@csg D02 IJTNAPN JRATED “e:sae—ejéa‘ DROB” D02 wdﬁeéabel :3@6:33%;(3%.



6. 63c TFORE SWHTR- RO WRIIT 63 TFIREY  (IV)Se  DOBT
STTOOD T WNOATTI, m’e@m’s@c:’%, QOTIT:~

“(lv-) 0N FBseod BeenTE  Jodeemoood®y) REFD  8BZW0R 200
NELITONE TRTT BRTN ATs;”

7. T3¢ TEOHT SWHWIR.~ SRV BRAOTT 736 TFTLTY,~

(D) (DSBe LBTFTeF, B3 BROOITR, BEOIRERTBITN, HOTWS:—

“(1) 53¢ TFTT ©RODY S-S ROT 2O WBFODZY, ALTOAT ITTOOD,
PP 0eSONYODH FOTREF DT WWFODNT), ALTOIT OJV0FTOOT WRJB)  OINRIR
Seconrd  mRE0®)  63¢ BFORE  TVOGNYRD,  NDSTYMZR0m  BF
BTN BTOTOT QWOTEOPT),  TOSOTO  AWS0D  TRVST IBAT 300D
QODWIVTTOTOF  WORNRPR 8.9, JRCOTEIODT), DORRT  VRBWIDW W0
VBFODY, SCHORWTDD; WHF, OIJINPMR  ND BRFTe  d¥owT  FOTHFTY
See0BHEODTY,  WOBRT  VRBURNG S0 GFODTIET), Second  THTTH),
QODNIWTTRT WOF FTITIY, 291007 20T TOSOT BNSODT), TBRWIOT.”

(11) (3)Be TTTTRTY “DXD T/WENS” 20V TTPY WD TR FENTY “T0RT
TREAY” D00 TTNER, B3O3RCRIBTR,

8. 8¢ Wromm TICIAEI.- RO VOICHIT 8IJe TFCF, B BROOITI),
BBodeeRAII), 20TT:~

"8. B VPR DHTINC BOTDIRTI JOTTNY T3~ (1) VR VT[O DTOINT
DOTNENTE T[OTOCNRE BWSR BP0 20y FOwOLEOH BN DFOODF ITOF BT VYT
OPIOINTIF DB BPoDd  Hedexr® Bewooororr, RGoHYS RN Jmseod
JOFNY s Wy TEIY, Bop ARFT, TRT PABRWT DB, DK ATFOY)
TORIBEFIT SHRT LD BEIQNEI), 2.IRRORTITI),

(2) Rep  OTPD DT[NT POTNERCE JOTT  RWEOIW,  BRDE
Re30deobRodPRY Ve BRTRY, ABOAT  Heewnd, NF  WDODTY, LI
FEpeod ToFodn B WRIODT DT HTORODY  TUIRT  GOTWORFRIR, B
Seonrod  FWOBNRFR, O0ToN MPIRCPNE HOTD BIK T WITLRFRZRYLD

megmsm.

(3) B OB DTO[NT PDONENRTZ BOTOT AN 03T)RWE WX 95
3RTZODI, MDIATY, SReoTHd PWOTTY, VT woAN Fywseod FoFoh FTIHYTTN
DB FIFLRT  BBBeod  TORSR OFPDw  FOTLRFPIOTION  SOWTR  $BeSTY
OFFBRBWTOTOZ, 07 CINT FOHBRI, TOTT JeR@HOZ 353@?533@53@6%
BBT0ST  [JFITD  ©oF  FSoIROW  JTeFITNTI,  ODHIOFIYD DT, J0FFH
BRODTBRIR Jpe0TEd THTICE WATHY BTOODI), FHEHISTR.



4

(4) BUY 9TE DNTOINT BDONIATE FOHTT BWS0IN, B3 TITRE ©BORNS
C3PFTe DTODT BE3 W0 DFTH SN, DB DJeRDN T3 BNOOT ATODNY
Rowopny AN TEEI®  AoLE 19083 wROHNY  HoB0HI), SEWENT  AQS
FOIPOODT TP WRTTNATI, moada‘gd%, OBV~

(i) ComB odPBe PNROW IWFTe TEOD TIRTOSODTY, XD TIWTYT
B WTYODTBAFTD TOMR SBID, TRPITBIT ¢S BOCFRORY;

({i) oSPPTe TRRDeRIND DB FOFOIT), BRDFPI DB 2.BNRTYT;

(i) ©PEINNY Ded WpFTe AV S, ALTORTD;

(iv) O3RPTe TOIPOOH WPHD FedeOW0T OIRPTE AOTFRIT oS o
B0 TIOHI, GRETOF;

(V) QODNBRTOTT 0T0e 3T D@WOD. "

9. 98¢ JFTHOT STHIR.—~ R VRICHIT 93¢ TFTRTY,~

(1) (DBe BTORBY  THRDYRIR,” Q0w BHF BT ‘200D,
MOA’%O&F@&&, fa:%é@ﬁ@?,” Q0L ajzjﬁeéab& ﬁe@ﬁ:a‘ﬁ&d%; m:ag

(i) (2)SBe LTTTTEHT ITLTOD B3 WOOOT TIOBTRTY, KeOITZRY, 2OTT:—

“TooB, FFFUEET ITID WB) DFFWIT (stake holder)osdodn ey
RBRT BwedIe .08, MeTBIHY.”

10. 90 TFONTm XeTEB- DO WOAODIPT  9F¢ TFORD  ITOD
BROQITR, ReOBIZLR, 0TI~

9. BEY FRIN I ¥IT IWING JIgobensv~ (1) IFe Tpoes wBOHY
TES03PT IHT AWS0ID B3 WNONT JFORFNRTI), IVFLATIT), H0TT:~

(2) B3 LRICNIT YT BTN aﬁdmggoﬁ S7o0T  R0ee TN OVEAL NG mﬁ@mﬂ
BWNCFTTET BOWOTTY WFONT [RWTTD B STTRY BPWHT;

(D) Bwo FIFODF, 20D, ONDT Y SETOZRGIoD (prescription audit)
TOTWTHHY TG HRDLNTR, TRLD.

() B3RBOW ©Bweer, Bed wEwe WIZOH SET INOOD Wi Ty R5OF Y,
STPOR PR D) NG BRAFT AN aﬁdcséaeoda xoz’éﬁ@mﬂ Ao ddmiaiogl

TROLRWIRDR; )
() Doz, ATOFTHR VOVNIVIITT 03TTYTE 3BT THoOREF M.

(2) Doz, RToFOR BT RNSoD  SFAT S0esn WIZoH  T3A3ROW wmg
TONYR, INDBPFWTD DB NG INFT 00BN 353503 xox);mﬂ DY TONID,
ANOTRBWIOD.



5

(3) B0 VT -TT BWINW.~ (D) To ATF T, JONNIWTNTOT WOF 73033?5033
dezsdraoaﬁ 007 HOd, VT -ToT AWSNTIR, 3T TRWTIT;

(D) QOPNIWTTRT WOF FOONFBI), VW -TOT IW30XN IVFHLITITH B
33, WOOODT, Toz, AOFTE, LTI TONEASMON BYIBTT;

(%) 93¢ BFOHT WBODY TBITHT BT AW ©Fwe (3)Ie YBBBFTT
ORODY  TBI0PT  WE-TTF  BNSOW,  IF, B[PODFATRH,  IBFLIBY,
QONNTVTTIOT 90T Roﬁramswo‘% @&ﬁbﬁé%&b@; B

(B) BNEOD AFFTeIT ITID, Toz ITOFTRY JODNBLTIWOTOF  FoIoeo a,jézs
B OF 3, wPHe oeRTe 3T FIRYR WTF TNTIF,."

11. 103¢ FBSRE SWTIR.~ SRV LHIODRT 103¢ BFTTY,~

(1) (1)3e TJESDTY,-

(D) "BWFNY DONTY,” B “esvdF THODZ,” D0W THINED WT AT
BENGY O TIWNY SHo0d “wPme Toz ATOFTR) AND TRAT TTXZ),” 200 IBNRIY,
ReORITT; |

Q -

(D) “BeBTe POIEY” 20w IENER DeTw TR0 x@mgs 953D

FNIBEREBONYT” D0 JWNTR, FeOTIF.

(i) (2)Be WTTFSPBY  “WBFNOT” 00 BJBRYR ST Tk, RFFTH)
ANOTBAT” 20w TTRYI, FeOTITT;

(iil) (2)Be WHTFTT SHTOD B3 BROOITT, BeOTBIW), HOTT:-

'(3) Tgodeomd AN FTdeod FOFOIN, Tvw ATFTY INOTBAT TR,
ODIORIFR, DR CeeNT DTOR B[T WO, BET TRTD, TFERD  WRIFNW
LYRPOBOZ, BIWAD, TOAN WFNH, 3T W¥ITY 3B TPod, eI o TR,
TRZRESNTR MY WBDFW (BoLSeRT®), BemTY AOMPID ([OTYOE?), ITPSReIT
WD) LOTITe HOeE T TOODFAFOIND ) oIPTe TF|O  WINTH TWBewd
Tonde  Redwod Tom, ABFOR) JNOTBAT  ©OF  TINLNOIW BN ézﬁgﬂdb
WPRFNIIH ZIODITR .

(4) Bo3eod 833N ﬁédzs%eoja xo,‘%odaa, INOTBAT TONHD D WPWFNRYY
ReDAYT  w3reN, TToPBY wFPwo w8IF IBodIWwen, TweN wEmo BN
ATOODTOR, FRWTI[OT  WOTOIINT, LBNATTT) I 03T VLY LOTOINTIY,
WNETIFTH Q.

12. 113¢ TJFORE STHTR.—~ 2RO HPRAONIT 11S8e TBTTY,~

(1) (DI DoBT FeIoDHY “éﬁdaé.rae@gci%” QN0 TTE  SV@OD  “eon
Soa’arwbaééﬁe; ROTPFTQ,  IoIN ﬁédzs%eoja ﬁoxjpodaa BRONBRID,  FTOWSHLD



6

&,agojaw@:jd BreeAoD 23@33534 dgmw @wséms Bd@eﬁédgﬁodamol mﬁﬁ:ﬁa’@cﬁ%” D0W
acsne;m& ;3@@:33%&5%; mg

(11) (iv)Se DoBH IO 3 BWOOIW, FeORIZT), HOTT:~

(V) Bdcdeomd smean Bmseod xom;oiw, TORFBATON ROPwoN Forsm 0T
R90Q deenod BT HE RN FTsecd FOFNY AT, TESFRIYT;

(V) BBo3eom AN F@secd TOZOI, BI0I WyFTRE FoBRFRQ, WS,
TBVE TPRDTOZ 2TA0H  H[PBTBe, TFoEe MNITETHI, TR, WBIFW, TPOTHTY
VT, NBI TBAONYOT TRALY TRRERFWTOD.”

13. 11& Brz ZJFOHT JeTrd— DA OHIODIE 118 TOed 3BT &8
BRODTTI, ACORIFT, HOTT:~

"11a. SeeNcd TP Iy TN Frseed BoRRY IJT0.- T3odey) TN O
VOTIZ BEDOW ﬁdxéda B SToRN dédéi’seoio ﬁo:?pofm, BRENOH B &I9FN dédééeoda
BoFodH FINIY IDFHTRAT THND D) FIFFIAI, BRODTIZI), deenod I
oAN B@secd FoFNY IINT  oIRPTe  WOPOFIODT, 8¢ TITT  ©RODY
T23I0300 BOWERTZ HOTT AWSR e DABTN,

1120, ©DIRUCHI, SHWTIR IPEL ¥, INFOT WRWO.- (1) T, ITFT),
VHRRBIOD TRV, VDIAWONYST OIPRTC  SPRTONTIY, FORWIDT,  STWHHR

TRTOTOW D0 aw%abcswa'obdo.

(2) B3 TBORE ©RODY Tow, FFUFTR) BHTBAT TBOIROWD WRAHBIODI, oo,
REF OB G0POD IBING 00T DORTIZE),”

14. 128¢ Jzorec aw%m.- RY LHACHRT 128¢ TFTRE (2)Se SVTTBTT
2T B8 moésdm‘i N’eaxa’@d%, D0TT:~

“TToBD, o7 0IWFTC BRLSCHTY, VBT BINR WLTONIBITITL.”

L MaY0)

15. 158¢ TFOHE SWIR.—~ RO VHAICHIT 158 IJons (DIde evTZITRT
BOOBDITY  “ONBTY  DeNIWT  DROFT 0L IWNE  INTO0D  “Tere  oIng
FVONBRER  wPBReANYR  3BT&LIT0T ejd@eﬁédgﬁmﬁ wém’éﬁemol VIR TBIY,
DWTTRAZHOW" 202 DTN, ;3@@;33%&33%.

16. 163¢ T[FTRE STWTR.~ RO VHICHDT 163¢ TFTTY,-

(1) “oeed TRTTPY” 200 JWNT @D “SReoBE TRTTT et 0w
BRI, FeORIZT; DB



(if) (%) DOTWE &5 JWNOOITI), TS PEBTBT, H0TT:~
“(R) SO JBeEJT
(so3naBera, odneme BB TFS w83, 0TI, AT,

F BReWodRET) - XTI

(B) BRG 200033, 30T IToF T — RBRT.”

17. 183¢ TFOHT STIR.~ PO LRIOHIT  183¢  TORTY TR0
BB BpoTHNG  wFEme [HTD,” H0w  JINETY, I, VOLTI zséolojoa’pol
REDVBIZ,

18. 198%¢ Z[FTeT STHTJR.~ FRO WHAOIDT 193¢ T[ITRTY,-

() (DFe WBFFORTY “BL) FNT” Q00 IJBRAYR DT ©F7 DOV ToNPI,
BBOIRCRTITIY;

(i1) (4)3e HBFF3TY,-

(P) “BH ondRIR DTORWTDTOT WIQMN FToUWOR  STOWOT ), DT
TONT  CRTOWNST  DROIWIRT” 200  IBNOR "R [HENER
DTOFWIDTT WBOMON TR égoaaod DB 20w ©F TRTOWNYR
DFOBWTOTOT” DO BJHINET, T303ReBITTTY; W)

(D) 0T THFB WBRODIJTR  JROFWTDIOT  ToTOR SFoWOTW NI T
AONT  CRTOOINGHIR  DRORWITT” Q00 JINER "W SRENY

OTQONITR DFORWTVTRT TOTVTOR STOWOT 0B VW ©F TRTICWNN
DFOBTTOE” DO BJINYT, DB303ReBIITTY,

(iii) (4)Se TTFTRET SHTOD &5 BWHOD[T, XeORIZTY, HOTT:—

"(4) o3  BFOIW, 103¢  T[FTRT  QUTWOTNER, YVYOPATY, WTTIG
QraroDTT  WeG, ST SONWNYN0Z  IRRVODYT  BTT BT IWENAYWITR
DIOBVITIT WIQMON FoURRDOT B fae%m TONT TRTPORNYNOZ BRIV
STT DWW ©F CRTOINIITR  IFOFVITOD wmﬁo&aocs BORITNSTT), GBI
[RIER OFHe SL0TEBOD THSR DB (2) I, (3)I¢ WwITFTNY VRO 33,
BRWO BHTNOTIONBIT,"; =B

(iv) (5)Se TEORTY “Dd WAT” 200 JEAER ‘20T ©F7 20w TENLI,
T30dRe3RBTD,

19. oDRRWH FeTrRd.— P WOIODDT 285¢ TITHET ST[OD & BVOLT
SEVAMCILW N ﬂe@#é@d%, DNOTT:—-



8

OB
(28¢ TeTrew (RFF) DoB W3y 11V agsdsadz&el SRR)

dreenod BRE Y zﬂo:jpoﬁa BRT®.
I. deeich BIW (BHAD) ~
(1) og:8 : I3odwee) CweeNod, 83 BVORTHNERN JFIY, moadégd%,
QOTT:— ‘
(1) 038 TegoRs NI, ITI0ITE  wIeBRR,  FOTWRT -
SOFT x%sms, BODRY, don eﬁéoﬁ% m@sms, PE, 208,
mox&e@% @ms%é’mﬁo, PoT® DB) PNRRPT ROND BT
Todeodd  BOOdRemINWD  BNIYBII, Nl BrchdegDe
23BODT, JLTORDT TBY;
(11) 3=, ke RRF, DB TIFONII, TeHPTR,  WONRPYTE,
RBRTSe, Dfaley ITIIFROIVOLD SRV, B, AN ée@'&@%f%as

BB

()@ 003 Rewsod, B@E@oN wTCINJOZ =B B,
WRTLETND[W WD) BRELRTWOWTY,  Tone  BRONEMRN
&I0T SONY BOBD DTN BeeNt TORYTRY, Dtatelela
DEETHT; D)

(iv) Bo3or XoTgFraQ o3mTRy, FoTsFRSedow Wil TPLE BB
:505'36?53530l WBNRFHT.

2) r?aejéé’ abz_op nogs.— @éoﬁx&g) BRENOID B BNODIZNEMN 56&53&
moada’%&cﬁ%, DOTT:—

() Bopss M™OST 3, D S 080T WY IR
BeRERBIYE TFRBODY, BECWR;

(i) HOed DY 288Z0D V[HODY APBNT;

(i) BT DNTOIRER B, dOFE HOT TI;

(Vi) 87088 ) xao:dw\%% RO INTOT &BS DIeR ©L[FTINER ©&F8
BT B RTDRZT;

(V) 6538 Sriseod y3obh OB RTYID T,

(3) In%3.- B33y, TREN VTP ©IT VOEE DOW IATIAD B8
BWROOT TFD, TROQTITT, QOTT:—

(i) Beenod ©BIoH DI ©IH IRIBEE  OBPFSRREANT  FOITYT
ZRRODY B3N SLSOD, LBNROTHT;



(i) SFZseod AH, DT T, ¥EZ T FODFIFOST DTTNY BOB
ROTREDE BIESOPT, BETIRARIYT;

(iii) ©303 %3033?3%6:8 B TOOTFFFIWOT VBT TTHOD RO W&
BROF JOFTBR, BWRBIY WB|OTY, DRTFARPRT 333 B0 TLeF
20D oOdesTro JIOD;

(iv) ©zod HoPBrsh, BJOIRRIND J0esT 88Ty FIOINWD D)
SRWTDTT  BROTBNY  wIf WTOR SHTET B OTH SLE TR
QOFTNTTY, TPBWLY RADFFRAPDID DB, Tz deexs DB BITO
BFODODY ©B[IZY, W IMPBROT)T;

(V) o0R 833 Qe BROOD SITND, BreXerned &5 oRny =,808
TBOFOTNY WA, 08 30D, BRCTDYT;

(Vi) ©TT 3BT TSNS BIODI), ST W) REBOROES B0eOF;

(vii) 23830 Q0edB [PE w75 BOTRDE JLIODTY, DT BERH D)
BOEENY DWBTF oD FTHATTY JeTTI;

(Viii) 3803 AODTAD B, DIONTNY OB [PLE; T,

(IX) ©ONTOST BOB TInkod.

(4) oI~ BBodey) BReN Bt BRODI BII), BRODTIZI,~
(i) 283, STBead Rgpéods B0 HTBIe WPTWODBJI, BRCDFHT; =B

(i) 2, w3Zod ORI, JBOVRW, WTOOTW BT IR O3PR
PUZTETN BROTVHTOTR e;soi% m@éfa%uam.

(5) WOZRTR T3~ T30IRL), TReN B3 TNODT BIR), BRONTBZTR,~

() wdpery TIRODT, LBNAT TOTLIOD RVT WPDd IFFO STREr,
TRHTTNRROONR B3 emcﬁoe%gﬁ REDQEBTNDT TRHTTT SRV BRI,
TNIRT BPOT TY0RB/R, TEOWYT;

(il) B33 3PTPOD w7} DTN DB TRFI0EIFTON BePBRREYT;

(i) somn FTBeod k’oﬁ@ojaegs I3 @@ﬁd§ DeL) FQRFTD DH
Be03 FOB03T B0B IDT WIHTY, 2IYONTBROY.

II. Beencd Remmdinw.—- D3cdwy) dweNodD,-

(1) 2&TNTRDWRYTOY TREPEFS.~ DVVOWT VFT0 BTHOD VETATI),
2&TONBTRDRY 2383 Jewds dédédrao&ﬁ TORIEIFI QTBIR);
(2) #330D VWTROR.~ B3R, TRENOIN,-

() BB, FOBEF T (LTWOLFROFN) FIONBI)Y, TARTYT;



10

(i) décséd 23Ty O3RCRTOH WDITRODNI), VRITON TORTHT;

(il) BB D) IS WIZEW0T FWeos VOEFRTI), ANTRRI;

(iv) 28830 o3PPBe FPNBI, @Z;b"éi-‘;%ifa%@ TR BY W a%%:?’vodsmcl
ODTORBY O3 BHLONH FOWWORY BT Wil BBON SRS AR
T[T TTE, STPYT;

(V) 030D TRBL0 A0DNAT BLOTLIAYY  AF0DToN aue;ri.ra%i%as TPOT
dédéz%eoda o) CleM) w@p«:ﬁoé%o&)od ARIATRTSSRI VN em%eswabel TBEERORTD.

(3) wlntry [PESMN Fosy- TdoIRy, TeNED IR STRETTHN
STRENBS  WPRAND DB TTOOS  BHTWINGD, ITFLBIY I,
TODFPEE  ODRTTN IPEIILH DI SCRIE =IO,
BRe0BRYBITY,

(4) TROTBrER I WIweedsd.~ F3odne) TRENOIN,-

() =omoxDTO WITY  FITPOINYTON  AONWAT ~ BIQND  DF
OPYNPOTONHT B30T TOFOINAD I AT LDICHNKL  w.e¥rieoBod
833D TRNATL, (FoNT,) @Z;Sér,%ira%@ TR BONT, [IRWFD;

(Il) =0pHToH VePrish NI T Jpee JIRTW, DI/ VP
TORRDLLTTN O LBUON BRTF TN BRCTT)T;

(i) =SPERS BROTW FOTPFTY  STOR  SPLE B V=[B3ROLR
BURFRRT; DB

(iv) ToBS DB, BT FOIT i [TD AERDFYW;

(5) Sw3.~ Fdodny), BeeNOIN,-

() S[D DB TgE DT DI WE eI BTBeoDd  220DODE,
MPOQTBTIR;

(il) =38 ogZo PFTORFT AONINER wd@mﬁdéfs:p%;

(i) Soonmzen H[OAW WBIZOH waZ BPRYZ, POITIW B FROTY
RN, TOTEBIZT); B

(iv) 3B ozme «IZod PCOHOHRT, WTTIRNTRBEANRTY, ©TT
DS B SRRDBY wFme  9TOR ER0TTOIN0  SRERH)TTY
LYRPYBIFY (3PP YLQOFIOID FIoFET Fdeod Fewo  Az)oLOD
S HoF DB de}déaeods ez ﬁorv;mi ?{iﬁ TR Scéﬁ&%as OV,
20093 (2009 T FZoFET LROCDI 1) VRODY [OWE, FITERTINWIIWD);



11

III e33n Fjmseod :)‘o:);o.b BR

(1) =TRBr3Ed HF) Woserdsd.~ TSRO WOAN FTBeod xoz’éom,—

(D) 330 ROTIFRIND, TODFIGOIND, TWOeE ) 57\; 232N SN0
OTORRLODTY, WHNEYT B, DT [T DPNTY, LBNTBTRY; DI
(i) ZmDB Beenmg (diagnostic) Fnd oFm B#IZRI, STHeORTY
BRENOD BBFING W [0S JeTBIZTY,

(2) Betn Rt~ TBBAROWH CRENOID S30AN 3,508 FOF O, ~

() 33wy TCRENODIZ, BIF TOOSVDTOD  BTHODY  WBFRLD DR
TVORD RPTT Hed DI ©II FDIAD D) FYIERII, oIPYTIe
WEBRNAYYE ©FT0 3R0TORPYT JeFeD  ©TJNE0s  0e8oHhY falel
2308303 Hewo TLIONT, JeBWFYT;

(if) Seenit ©33 X b3 VP FOWORTTRY, TOeFY BPBROIPTR FTZTHHOZ
BREBIBAT;

(3) BreNod SHTYEMN TOFVBHO FOST.~ BI3HRY, FTBI,~

(i) Beenod BemE s, @0odT Bwenmd (diagnostic) @¥ewmE
z%%%oda OB ATYHOT TENYY &BAR ROFTN BTPF DN TOMFOZ
DTORTT;

(i) BeeNodd B[ Beer APOFTNYRY, [RBL BIIZ), FDFFRRVTLD
DRk, 23T DFOODTTY, JOPWWRT DY, dwenmg  (diagnostic),
1983 3 BIRGT wodyny wij $33R00% 318 D,

(i) Fdodeomd TWOIPFODHT  TEIREHRIND DB WIWOD  FOFING W0
BN DIFEY, [PR SIIN, ITPPIARPY DB IRFF, THT 27 S
B3, 2FODTY, VEWTTINL BHOWBTODITH Q.

(4) Bethod TZOT VTS~ BBOILPOTD AN BT 3eod xom;om,—

() BreNcd FITI, BIW, VONET DB HODOHY TFEIFITI);

(if) =deer} TTHODD, LBNAS @p@ﬁérﬁe;cg BeeNod BITI), T0DTT
BB TOTD A’ée;mﬂg TEOFRBZTWY; B

(ili) B3OIT STBeod TFOHY II, IRTT VFFBY BRENOD FZ T,
SENEORINCEJT L 1as iy



12

wcéczﬁr{% By RTINS e

BJOFWE  WORN  FTseod 730%@71%1 VOV 2007, (20073 FIOF 3T
PRIONT 21) B3 [ROOIFHNEMON SHNDR TRWRT @w%ﬁoab SONEBRNT, 0TT;—

(i) BReNns BOTNERTIOD D[OTTTN R WFwo WTOINT BODINTE H[OTT
RSO, TLIRIT;

(i) sovan STseod :Soﬂcpmfo TBOIROTD JINFT  WIZR  FornbRIesors TOND
O WRIEFNTI), INOTRRED 0%, xﬁrdi; ORTTTN, BRI B 3&@6 TNSOD
570RT  Fedrt 23ed 3¢S B[AFS  aAN  FIHeod xo%ﬁ@ﬁ A o IIENISe] TONR,
HRBHBIRTT;

(ili) oo, RTFTR JINOTRADTBIOT T3 TONT, WoRN JTIeod :Soﬂcpmfo
RONWATY, T®.25000/~ 308 TR VYD ©TT 00.5.00 OIRYITR  HZORVTET
2OORIBOPT, T S oNHNAYN0T AT VYT TS AW JHFIR DBORWITRT
FOOTORTR, WORTYTI;

(Iv) SpcoTEd TRFTTTY, TIT” TWROFT;

(V) 2R00INT  DBRWODPYIHBOZ a0AN  &,36e0D :o”o;-o;mfcg deeNod AZT
B S00RN BT 30 xoﬁcpofo RITD, VOF FEBROJT;

(Vi) B0BF 8330H FOTPFTY TRENCWOT ©Fmo TRENOD TSAQEWOT [VONT
TRWEODT), WIYORBARB/OSY;

(vil) RowormEy IR =N BeBI, BRVOBORE BIONTY odwFe 30 BRZE
2.BYONATe BDOODTY, WOINTR, FNOTWAZHT; I

(vii) 193¢ BFOHTRODNY HRRWTDTT IO TOBNTD, PR, 30y @8
SDRONE T TWAONTTT STRIBNATI, BRT SRBGINT.

e:scfgpocj T3 DGEONT.



13

BRFT TS TS
[=d -

TN ToRTOZT T 0IpRTe TYT SEII, LIRROBHIHOQ.

=0



14

BT8R CNT JIT TUTHTTT BB m@&‘ﬁ T3

DR 7T 8 DoBEBBONY  BedeeRRBeIomd  wgedZoed  TRe Biodrem (DIe
YOBTFOEO) 0o XFoF T~
() 30N FT 30 xo%ﬁ@ﬁ 30 OINTRYR SRCOTEBONT, [OWPTO [T
WHDY OVFONIW, STIDRT AFOIT HOB J0DTNTI, TLRLY; B
(V) BecoTd TPHTVTT  TVROT  TOSOTD BN, TWRII DPOTIZ,
B0B AONTNTR, Tedze,
~QT0 DT,

903 8 | geoleenton ouiedRons 83 FFURE (4)Sc LTBEORE (V)Se o, 2oy
BTEO TO[INT BDONERTS TOTOT FWSOD TROT 38N odRx)Be 933
PRODT BOD ?Dodaaimeém& T23men oo, ﬁﬁ)i—‘d%ﬁ @amws{l Zbeabgcﬁ.

S0 10 | XeORLY YT EOTPT NOT I~

(1) (DIe LTTFORT (B) DOBP), IpTZ FWSNWD DI ¥IT AWENE ¥IT
WFoORFNY B0 Zbodaaﬂaﬁeémel Jedzen ooz ﬁﬁi—‘d%ﬁ @amws{l Zbeabgcﬁ;

(i) (3)Be NTWDOT),—

() () DOBP), VT -TOFT FWENY TS NP ©TT BT F0J oD,
DOFIBRIAT  DHOIT DO JOPTONFD, TR Toz, :Sw-‘déﬁ BHTIII,
DERTT;

(D) (V) DOBY), VTF-TF FWEOD ToODFITFHEH DB Tz, NEOF U3 ©TT
SOOONT, AYRE  QTOSTIY, PO JODTNTI), TWRL oK XTOFTY
©OTTTIY, DEDTT;

() (*) DOTY, PP RN3 W) VT -TOT TNS0D  JTODFNII,
DTFLAPYTTN  TOODFATOIE  WOB  JODINTT, TedFed Tow, AFOF Y
©OTTBIY, QEIITTI; B

(B) (B) Do, BNWINY FFFTeIT ITIOR Toders P, D) DI FEN
Clavoliberlef 253571%‘3 VTFI0D  WOB  A0DTATT, TBB OOz, REOFTY
©OTTBIY, DEDTT.

TN TTY03R0BT ToII TBTORTITRY woRFOD ATHPTTHNT.

) =73

3.:30°. OTHeT® BDRRT®
s, I DI BB WO

Q. opSE
FOORFTAF (T)
BIOFEIB QTS XY




15

ORWOG

Boor 3T SSo3N dgdsaeofp :)’o:’éne.? RV, 200738 (20073 FTr 3T WRICHT 750935. 21)

wd@g won
XX XX XX
2. JOWRIN.~ 81 HICDITY BOTHF) @séc;sa @713535532)5 BT, —
XX XX XX

(@) "awed" H0TT, wheen, I PDENOW FURED QYA WTTO ROTLOF NTOT
FIOF 3T NTOFTT T30 dédéwc;pé B, BRCWCINETE AL,

XX XX XX
(2257) "Foeod TOdeoT FWS" 20T, 8I¢ FFTRTRODY TLBIRT  FFeod
TWOBELTD RN &;

XX XX XX

(20F) "BBBeod 88" 20TV, VERTIOD WP YIT BRPBE IRIZ TET
3,3, a’%@rﬁ%doqﬁ BO3NJEFT, ONTOR, T3 eeIe, odwen, FoodeeR3 de}wa@%é,
@’j@é z.%%% 53390 Pvc;p QNG SPOT odaaﬁ;az% wéioda eﬁd@eﬁé %(gpéofnai)al TOOTEN LT
Odyde CRNSR, MOTBFW OFm IENLL SR T deenvmed DB 33E;
B AW BRTOTO" B SRJRO® 3IINTI), WHRNIT;

(D0) "SAFOIT Teo" HOTT, @%éoﬁaod, TONOOT T (C%&oﬁ T
BRIT) ©IFZEROT WIEWE BReNNTT, SReNNe ©FDe ©ITIoD WIZoH wFm
BBRETEI), mmm%@%w NTEINOT VT DTLOS0H W eITWN WFWO B JFTRT
(D) DOBTY TeFTONDT W EBNVN ODTHTROT WP WTRTONTT emcgeeﬁa%ﬁ
OPT  QRTOTCH  WFEITN  RTIION  [INE, wdm@&fa%igw 90

m&)@o&a@%@e&gp 2,00 m‘oz’é;

(25%) "wRN FTBeod FOF' 0TT, TANRMNY T FANNYYONS 83
OBPTD TSN, TIFONT Teeo, 38Ty JOIRCTPOOD, TRINITOI 0B, IJRRE NIF,
O8RQ, 33T Woedy 8eoBW, AP OMT Be0W, ACIREFIL 30T, 8ITOOD, TIFIT,
BTROTD 00T, (L0EIHEIE0DE PWEIORBR) T FOTF BITOR CRN ITWRE, BN
oD, Cweent  IBMENNT  wPTo  TRENTLEIBRT  OP@e WO B3e308 ;%&ma
(B32392360830£02300223) desdé&eoda 2383, "N:a@?%ﬁ@&d WONWD  OdBe  IXOOT
FEODWITTOTOT QST Aioajpﬁ@o WF) OO Rewo ©PI0 WAN m’om;ﬁem)al aae;ﬁ,rae;%gd
sT38,—

XX XX XX



16

(50°) "Spc0Ted THTT" H0TT 43¢ BFTRTY WLeDICT 0T HTT.

XX XX XX
3. axn FTseod ToFNG [econE~ B VHICDRT TROOFT IHoD ST,
BenS B3 RIONWT VRODY  OWHRTHT JROTEFOD WOTFINL Tone RTDAYR
VTN TRTID OBEY o3YTIe  ooBN  FTseoD xo:o;ﬁeémol m@&xsg%g,
SEITIRQ T IVFLITITO:

TOOBD, B3 LHICHINT  TRBOFT  ITWBHATFBY  WAZTYLH 003N FT3Beod
ROFNSL TIRFWS RN FBseod FOZNG (SHIR)  wpRobh, 20108 TToFT
DIVOTOOT RT SoNLRARYR ©ox Jecodedmn wilr FQIIFTT D) ©TT Hed
ST TRBTJFOMR ©BF 0D, ASTRBDITCR OTW), SBIWIDW T ABFLABROE

L TTON.

XX XX XX

4. [econed WPT|S.- B3 IYTOR ATATI, wERROBOZ FE BIONY 20w
SREOTES TWRTTY [ITIW), HOTT:—

(@) | BEOH BRPTO DI

(W) | BGoD Bwer, DB BEN0W TR RTF, TODFTSF
Clakpte!

(R) | NOWORAT BLOH FTECOD FTHeOD RTRTD
ROFTT @cjg/ﬁojﬁdé?

(B) | BUg wCnT ©QTO ATHI

(R) | BOWORAT VLD §PTIT BONT ATRD

ROOINE FOFT OFFR/ TODFTEE

XX XX XX
5. Spconedmen wur.~ (1) 23N FTHeod :o’o:%ﬁe;mol AT, SBTED, JTF LI
OFPT  IFRZT, DB, IVTERRPTR,  DVOWTJSILY 2 ODEE B3odwy)  FHOIW
TOWORAT eoTIed @Cpﬁd% QDODNNTWITTOT IZRIODNY, 0T NFRTY Tome
©VOE BOWABI VWFODT, IYIIT I @BeS 3¢S AN [T seod xo:%ﬁeé Mt
T INFNRPN 33 3ed DOTIY, DONNE W TOTD.

XX XX XX



17

6. 3N Fymsecdh RoFnY VeconKmn BeTE enIInh.~ JeconHd TWHTIY)
é@eods@oiamd BOZNRVRIODT 003N aﬁe}cﬁéaeoja :doﬂ@ﬁe; SRCOTBMN VT 85 300D
BRDE @rﬁsééﬁe;md a’uadﬁemﬁdoﬁoe ebowacjm‘,l '@’67125:33@&5%, DOTT:—

XX XX XX
(iv) 2mRn Fseod RoFodd 9Fe BronY wwgedyT BRI MOEBLNAOR
RME0TONTS;
XX XX XX

7. ©BrRY DS~ (1) 53¢ TFOD ©RONY 0T WRFODNT), ALTOAT ITHTOD,
SpeoTEd TRRTTR)  63¢ TFORE  WOBOPNYR,  NMITZR0W DB
VBB FDONWTWITOZ amd%oﬁam‘{ ﬁ@@eoﬁa TOSCOTD TWEOHN NROT IBAIT 3TIWOON
QODNBUIDTIOEOT  ROBNAPT  LYTLD), JpCOTEIONTY, WOBHAT  TRBVTTD  VFT0
©RF oI, 3TFORLITBII:

TWOOBD, BpeoTES THTTR) VBRFDITIR II, VBTV, VEPEAYLD WTTIBI,
QBT TRTD  DP, ©OF 86@6%& TTENTD), TONIAT BRTD VRFODI],
$TROTBIZ Q.

XX XX XX
(3) (NIe YT TFORET HEODY ORATD BRRT TBOIROD JRCOTEIOID VTN
BRFNY THOD TR AOTNIIZ, BROOWIT T, A0DNIWTWITOF JFOITY, DB
Vo7  WOBJI), RO ©RF  IQAT eS0T WO VW DRIFNY 0N
JNCTORWIOD.

XX XX XX
8. Yoecdh [O2ewm® TN~ (1) F3odRow RYOD 0TS TWOTTY), 88 VITHT
(2)3e woTTESEe Tonw T3¢ TITT (IS LT JFORTY INFTIBAT YOG SRAVTON
O IDFFBRBWTDEIEOF  FINTI), LIRROEOZ F303e0w BYR 2o OTm T
BP0 TOSCOTY AN, TUHIIW.

(2) :gp@eoda VOSCOT BNSOID VRTF [ SBRL), VTTo BRTZ, ALFOAT Hoed
8 VOVOPTT YWTWOFREI), ToNR WTIBODY Te3AT JoDTONRTIY, B0 Soelafxlown!
[IRATD, FDTE TN TORTNBOPOTD T DITER, WRBBRYLL oIF[e BT
RDODTY 47BN BT 50D :30:(3303353‘,l D0BOTLITOTR.

(3) ROdeLT RODTY 0IVR)TE BRCAND ©PTo BRTIND FOROTT, 5@@6033
TVOHCOTD BWIOID VB, JROTEH TRPTOTE, SPRIZW), JpconEd TWPRTTY) AN
.«:?e}cjzsz%eoda :30:?;033 wzsw:@pws:orﬁ, 83e30Y ADFFTRBWTTTOF FDORZ  WBHO3RYR
VT, FOTBR JBeFITNID. IWT0IT [WTTITD ©OF F30dRowd JBerITBI,



18

ORI BB, Tori IDFRTRAT W=QO3RIR Jpc0THd TWOTTE, Tort TWARWT 7

3 Q -0
STOODRY, BYRSYT,

XX XX XX
9. TheoRoyR.~ (1) TBodeomd PN IFTHeoD ﬁo;);odw, AWOD W) ©TT
DB END, 5323%% 3R8B, IWRENW, ¥ITT 7«3@%5@5, ROBSRAW, BReNNIR I
CENeT &me@é@%@pw@ﬁ LBNIBETT TP VRFT/EH TN 93BT AROIDAVNA
ROWORATOZ & LRIODDTY WGP WTTRONY TBICHT JONNYY ©wFT0 TS
23000DYNT BPFTIe TIRITY INOTBRRT MELTDLNET), TR0 WIBTW,

(2) DowRTFTR) PFOATOZ e3¢ 2T JReINeRt FOWORATOZ 3eT e3¢ TN
Bgeod oFnen Bed Bed rIURTR, INOTRRVBOW. Ped Led IPenen 50N
5663586033 ;ﬂoz);ﬁeé DNT BN DT INENPN @@@O% ANOTRR BT mwmﬁgﬁ%ﬁa&
RRUA To%, REFORY D RNSNTI, TURWID. 3T BeNSNG  FoodRews,
VRTWWOND B amm@@ﬁ% B 33;9 BN :f)d:%dmeé e DWOBING Tonw
TORND AODNITTOTOZ ATBTH .

10. QDT WwWENY  TWeIobRy, FTgdmded.~ (1) TBO3ROTD  oRA B,THe0D
FOFOID BReNTY Tonp TR, &IT SHJVIMN G BB 3e0H WHIRAVR DB 93T
Rednen ﬁomoﬁamcﬁég WOE NS aﬂ@;dojamcl FTVRRING OTew aamgﬁwg
OPOMTOZ DPBIFX) B WOF  LRVWF TN, aT0AN décjé%eoja #)o%oja BRWBJ0
FOTBY TEHFRIZT), ©OP IHRRE WPWo IOTBRENOD BIOHT, JRe0TEd TWHTTE
BBHIZTR.

(2) o3mT sTRN FTBOD ﬁo%odw BRENONOT UFw0 ©33 BOW0RONOT B0
OB[CW, SPRBANTTO0T  INDARE VP OTRINODY TNRT  WBFNOZ
BeH[OOIN DT DPAT Tone  TERDBROR BRWONT FOOIRHT THEDOD, JewTe
odnR)Te BRZBW), FORLRSTTQ.

1. so3n F@scod Zoned ©RF IPraneh.- Todeowd  wpAN  FBseod

#)o;gj o3, —

(1) BOROD B0 ToweNode HowTIE WP 0IPTIWTL 30800 OX @THosn,
SBRF OT WHEB BRBFTDN [BT RY MPOINRT ©FHe IR FeSIoD P
NI BY BNOT/TINER  w¥MOT JR0T BINTOF 2wn FTBCOD-FOIRT VTP
ORBAODH B TBoD-TRAT YOS w[T, TEH WY, AEITZ D, YT W
YD, BeBYS AORPVDE DBF THNER, SHHERYIIR,

XX XX XX

(Iv) OComRTFTsy) TowTwE ©OIAWBIVETTOF ZROB T3  Teenner
BOLORAT DJTMYR, SpCOTES TWPTOTT, L.BNITT,



19

XX XX XX
12. 2833 TNBNRY AT B~

XX XX XX
(2) Towy RWEOOOT H W A0FY ©9PF0 TF3 Bop AwES ©Fm 23T
WHTOOM IF, IIF[NYI, OFeRN JBJFLRTON, DY WITY SR, TOBeOIN
mﬁmﬁdé‘u;da.
) Q
XX XX XX
15. [RCOTHED BTPRD W Sga.— (1) JRC0TET  THTVR), TBROI STOTT
eSS 9Zw OZPo, B VPIONTT  WFW VTCRONY  TWAT  JOHINRY WP
SRCOTEIOD WIBNRY HYOTFFOIPNTODOTD HedR 833, FowWoRT, DDITY BTWeBBIY,

QDT TRV DD WEVY TN, ODITY TEDIWST DT LAN FIEeod
xoﬁ@oda SRCOTBODT), WTPSBRAPBLIE VT TWMRAPIWTR:

BOOD, ©OF STEBTZ, ToIN ﬁdcséaeofo m‘oféodaa OBIOOIY, ée@mg@ xeg
@5@55:&& QBT BRTD érad@m‘éﬁécg)g.

XX XX XX
16. wacen TRETWT.— B8 BNOOT m‘cs:sédaia& WHRPOTB  WOTD B0 TORTITEY
cadégcigg, QOTT:-

(@) | BToF s wBeer, ) B0 TURLIT BOINTL SIAK: (N
(W) | BIoF w3 wBRen, JeBNY ATer I RTHDD
(%) | R08e0D FTBIFS TR BReWO3ReTS RTHDO
QBes JID.
XX XX XX

18. 503N FTEech FoBRw IO RO F[WOons BLLNRY, SORTRBDRYTH.~
TBodromy vEN PTgeod FoFodd ABAReSIMON oFme oSRPBe |IT BH0H
e, TLIOWIOD [PWN  MRVTTND wFme APNTY, Fe[IYRD WIRBRRIIE
INIS XFFD [TONY DI, w3 FTH0H AWODODTT BIDNE), ToRITOF T )
SRCOTES THTTE, [TOTPEITE)

XX XX XX
19. Zo@Ineh.~ (1) odsa@'a&g) B30, T8¢ TFOHT HRODNY WOBRTD TIVBSIMT
SpeoTd  aEd  otd AN FTseod  FoFoDW, MAADY, IEWETY  oxw
Fowréorogc;)@’, OTWD, VTTEEP JRFODFE  TOBT  WRW  JRFNAPH  DIOTWIOTE



20

O[OOD  FUDR  dFCWOT WP, TH FDT  TRTOWNY [TV DBOBBIRT
mm@éoboocﬂ TOBILODTONBZTY,

XX XX XX

(4) o3meFpe), |BoId, SPCOTEIOD HTBRTI), LwROXH VT 12 oFm 133¢
TFOOT  QOTWORRIR,  WROPR 200 FWpeod FOZORW, SAWIBY  wFw
ATFRREFY wFTo (2)3e WB-TFORT WBODY VRTRICVT JTEFIINTD, TIZLD
DPOTITY, VI, VITG JIFIToT  ITOD, BT BORWARPR  DTOBLBTT
OBEMON TTOR SFOWOT B HTW KT BRTCRNER DOV IBTOT a:oeragoboocj
TOBRLODTONITL), 0B DVBEIC ©Tem0 BW[ONT PDTTIFT BOTHFTY, 20D IRET
OBRODFIR  DIOBWTOTRT  TTWR  STCWOT DI DD FONT  CRTOORNY  JBN
DROBWTTT mm@éo‘:)aocj TBOBIEODTONSTI.

(5) 2.2) F[BOIW, B3 VHICHIT VP VTORODY TWIVT  AODTT o3Tosyse
Patclo] ema)‘aaoz;rﬁez,fa:bgl PROLATY VT, VBTG  JPFOD[T  TOBT, P AT
BRITONFETNR DTOFWITOT mwagobaocj TBOBICODTONI T,

XX XX XX
28. JTIT Ty VYDA~ (1) FIVFWT TIN TAFON® BREONY (AOPOe)
AONT, 1976 (19768 FZoF eIz HIODI 75) 33& B TROT ATIIRAPICONT.

(2) TRt ATRBTONTYR,~

() JTAZ OICHIT HROHY [PBECT  BRHTC  TODF T
FReYens  odREe  FHTR, B UHAICDIVT  FOWD  LITWOTNRY
BBODY VRBEOING T FRAYLING Q0T GFODFIZ;

(V) B LRI TWBOFTNORTE, IRV JeoTedmen O
SDETTTN ATHBRROT VOICHIT VRO FOAT DY WRFNH D)
8 ORACHTT  RTOPT  QOT0ITO aéscﬁrd@pm @a’,rﬁeéab&
BoIRRePRIIR), DR WOF wRFOD BoWOTTY  SPPTTAR Y,
ROTROPTIPRTFY, VT, VBFTOTIN DHIOTRODTIRTBITL) W 0T
©2F R0, 8 HOACNMDT WTWOFNY ©BODY JeC0TFMN BRETIN
2IE O, 5@)}335&6% )

XX XX XX

X0 SOTFEEOOD, QTR PP T, Bonted, &7, AR , —-Jansb 1000, 123¢ I 2017

= > g



(Sez0ETRN WONLE0TRNAR)

FreiE DS 1
5&)@@&33@ QT 1P
Samqﬁc QI3 \

3TRFET ooRN FEibeod BORNY (3TRTH) DGeods, 20178 (20178 Imortss

DTR3 X3 Doy R0 24) ST,

&e 5. oT. Toe RXPT, STRery DI BED0W TR WOINWD [|HIT

TTOFLIT A0RN d’esdé%eoio soiq)mﬁ (3TRIE) DTeoDE, 201761‘ (20173 Bzorels
DR A Dedeaby Bomk: 24) S =w0BT STHTRoh, IBT 33, WA,
T 0T B3 NEE BTWoDBIeS, H0TT:i-

350 DPeoDITY,-
Low 8

(1) 83 worng, meodeeRzwd wFedRLRT 8¢ Qﬁdsad@,—

(2) (1)3e vosTFTeE B3 BROVITR, BECIRBIITL), HOWT:~

(1) Bop BT DTINT  POWENTT  TOTWONY  BwdR  Bod  Bep
WO2IVONIOD a‘w&}{moﬁa;@mraﬁ Clakplelowey @qﬁégoaﬂdéa;d% B YUY 2god
Badexr ApTooorow, BIoHYS exN FTseod NG T wyDd TBIY,
Bop AWET B, Tom, FRFOY TRRTFIT IRAT 0wy D DB JBIQNED,
LORRORTIEZ:

TT0B, WTOINT  DOTBERTI  JOTONS :3533303)33&, [OQTONT 243
eﬁmzéeqjcﬁ (%) DoET @RNY mazsmexﬁo Tol  PREART ITNT TTReSTY
TR

P TOOB, DT[N JBIT  FOWOFIY ooz, RTOF T é@%%éoﬁo
DROT JeDT RPRT, INT TODICD  9TT SO3NT/BOLS BOVTI BOTR 8RT3
TOTOONE BN30D mms%saﬂdsiw%"; DNk



2
(2) Redomen redens (3)Ie WBIFSDY ‘B0 @éﬁodéé, Slatapig
POV TJOEMK P VORI BHR "JRC0TE BOTTY, SYTIZTY Torwe” D0
TENED), TBOIRCBIIIT,
socr-11
(2) U3 DoBETY, (Ve YLTDOBET DROT  XedDILD emcée?m’@bcj 103¢
BBOT ()¢ IFFTRRY (2) HAIY “Ugme” 20w TS, “a“négp” DO TTHJ,
BBoIReBHITT),
orE-12
(3) 1283¢ DoBTY, (DI WTDOBTY; TR LRACHIHT 11Be TFTTY
RedFwe B edRoRT (VIS DORT 3o & INoOTTR, BeOITTT, L0BT:~
(VD) RODWTTET 07 dedohY oD FrIsecd BoR 0% BOIBY
ROTNBRTZ LTV @c&?dz}wﬂq}oﬁamel ﬁ%:dé%d%”
S0T-18
(4) 183 DordTY, (1) (1) I (Iv)Je LUTDOTML DB YR
TOLORAT IZRWNIR 83 FNOOITI), TIRRBRIZT), 20TT:-
“(1) (43¢ NTTFTTD,~
(22) “127 2o wosnen 10, 127 Qow LONYI), TSoIRRIIIT.
(R) 0B WRT CRTPOWNPR DFOTVIWT wITRIN0T” 20w THRAIN
0% ©F  TRIoNNPR DIORWIRT  WCYIWWOT” Q0w TTNEI,

[V}

@50&@&3535&%;

(2) 2T AT TRIONATE DFOTWIBIT @YIEN0T” 20w TTINEN

“0 @i e¥nsenlevsiatal @ﬁ@:ﬁw@md a:o@aeéaﬁaod” D0 mmﬂmel

(1) (5)F¢ TTICTY DD AT RToRNTIINR” 20w ITTENEAR

.00 ©8 TRIORATIIIN” 20w TENFR, FS3ReBRSZR,.”



3
Lor-19
(5)\ (19)3e 00BTY, FedTL VOB IRTHT BEPWODY,
\“I. RN BRI (BHN)” SeuF 30 WRONY,-
(2) (e T, (1D)Fe LT VR 85 JVOOITH), TEC3REBIIER,

R )

DOTT:—
“(11) 33 xm;mm?%ﬁ 333 ;Sainﬁérie:o a&égp 8656@??%3:% ée@&mfgp

=,
T

(@) (B¢ wpRIY (DI wOTPAT H L0oLITZY, TBoSReRIITRY,

Q0TIT:—
") wdee, TZRODE, LONTWB! FOTWIOH MewS WK LTFO
Gd.@fﬂé SeplalplelgtetnlolnTalE="! wcée%?éﬁ DL BTNNT THFTTT

T T ODTR, TBBoTE;”

QX BRI
FO0NE WS (To0)






Sexial No @

3
KARNATAKA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY
FOURTEENTH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY
FOURTEENTH SESSION
THE KARNATAKA PRIVATE MEDICAL ESTABLISHMENTS
(AMENDMENT) BILL, 2017

(L.A. Bill No. 24 of 2017)

A Bill further to amend the Karnataka Private Medical Establishments
Act, 2007.

Whereas it is expedient further to amend the Karnataka Private
Medical Establishments Act, 2007 (Karnataka Act 21 of 2007) for the
purposes hereinafter appearing;

Be it enacted by the Karnataka State Legislature in the sixty-eighth
year of the Republic of India, as follows:-

1. Short title and commencement.- (1) This Act may be called the
Karnataka Private Medical Establishments (Amendment) Act, 2017.

(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. Amendment of section 2.- In section 2 of the Karnataka Private
Medical Establishments Act, 2007 (Karnataka Act 21 of 2007) (hereinafter
referred to as the Principal Act) ,-

(i) after clause (e) the following shall be inserted, namely:-

"{e-1) "District or Metropolitan Grievance Redressal Committee”
means the District or Metropolitan Grievance Redressal
Committee constituted under section 8;";
(i)  for clause (h) the following shall be substituted,-
"(h) "Inspection Committee" means the Inspection Committee
constituted under section 7;";

(1) in clause (l) after the words "Acupressure treatments” the words
"and any other manner of treatment as may be notified by the
State Government from time to time" shall be inserted;

(iv)  after clause (m) the following shall be inserted, namely:-

"(m-1) "Patient’s Charter and  Private @ Medical
Establishment's Charter" means the rights and
responsibilities of the patient and the Private Medical
Establishments specified in the schedule;"

(v) in clause (n),-

(a) after the words " polyclinic" the words "Dental Clinic or
Dental Polyclinic" shall be inserted; and

(b) after the words "voluntary or private medical
establishments" the words "as may be notified by the State
Government by notification” shall be inserted.



(vi)  after clause (r) the following shall be inserted, namely:-
"(s) "schedule" means schedule appended to this Act.”

3. Amendment of section 3.- In section 3 of the Principal Act, in the
provisio after the words "till the disposal of the application” the words "and
shall comply with the provisions" shall be inserted.

4. Substitution of section 4.- For section 4 of the Principal Act, the
following shall be substituted, namely:-

"4, Registration Authority.-There shall be a Registration Authority
in each district consisting of the following members, namely:-

a | The Deputy Commissioner of the District Chairman

b | District Health and Family Welfare Officer Member
Secretary

¢ | District AYUSH Officer Member

d | Two members from recognized Association Members
representing modern medicine and other
systems of medicine nominated by the
Chairman

5. Amendment of section 5.- In section 5 of the Principal Act, after
the words "shall make an application” the words "through on-line" shall be
inserted.

6. Amendment of section 6.- In section 6 of the Principal Act, after
clause (iv) the following shall be inserted, namely:-

"(iv-a) that Private Medical Diagnostic Laboratory is located outside
200 meters radius of Government Hospital;"

7. Amendment of section 7.- In section 7 of the Principal Act,-

(i) for sub-section (1) the following shall be substituted, namely:-

"(1) On receipt of an application through on-line under section S the
Registration Authority may having regard to the provisions of
section 6 and after such enquiry as may be necessary, by the
Inspection Committee, either grant registration subject to that
conditions as may be prescribed or reject the application within
thirty days from the date of receipt of the complete application in
all respects; in case of any delay beyond thirty days the registration
shall be deemed to have been granted. The Registration Authority
may constitute the Inspection Committee consisting of such
members as may be prescribed."; and

(i1) in sub-section (3) for the words " five years" occurring in two places
the words " three years" shall be substituted.

8. Substitution of section 8.- For section 8 the Principal Act, the
following shall be substituted, namely:-



" 8. District or Metropolitan Grievance Redressal Committee.-

(1) The District or Metropolitan Grievance Redressal
Committee shall be headed by the Chief Executive Officer of the
Zilla Panchayat of the District and consists of Superintendent of
Police of the District, one representative among Private Medical
Establishments in the District, District Surgeon, Public
Prosecutor and Woman representatives to be nominated by the
State Government.

(2) The District or Metropoliton Grievance Redressal Committee,
either with prior intimation or on receiving a complaint, may at
reasonable time, inspect, a Private Medical Establishment to
satisfy itself that the provisions of this Act and the rules made
thereunder and the conditions of registration are being duly
observed.

(3) If any defects or deficiencies are observed by the District or
Metropolitan Grievance Redressal Committee shall direct the
Registration Authority or the Manager of the Private Medical
Establishment and the Karnataka Medical Council or AYUSH
council, as the case may be, to remedy the same as the case may
be, within such reasonable time, as may be specified in the order.
There upon the Manager shall comply with every such direction
and report the compliance to the Registration Authority within the
time so specified.

(4) The District or Metropolitan Grievance Redressal Committee
shall while investigating or enquiring any matter under this
section have all the powers of civil court trying a suit under the
code of civil procedure 1908, and in particular in respect of the
following matters, namely:-

(i) summoning and enforcing the attendance of any person from
any part of the State and examining him on oath;

(1) discovery and production of any documents and witness;

(111) receiving any evidence on affidavits;

(iv) requisitioning for any public record or copy there of from any
court or office; and

(v) any other matter which may be prescribed.

9. Amendment of section 9 .- In section 9 of the Principal Act,-

(i) in sub-section (1) after the words "standards"’, the words " staffing,
infrastructure, etc.,” shall be inserted; and

(1) after sub-section (2) the following proviso shall be inserted,
namely:-

"Provided that the number of non-official members and stake holder
shall not exceed one third of the total members".



10. Insertion of new section 9A.- After section 9 of the Principal Act,
the following shall be inserted namely:-

"9A. Functions of the Experts Committees and other
Committees.- (1) The Expert Committee constituted under section 9 shall
discharge the following functions, namely:-

(@) study and recommend classification of  Private Medical
Establishments on scientific basis for the purpose of this Act;

(b) laying down minimum standards of infrastructure, staffing,
prescription audit, etc.;

(c) make recommendation to the State Government regarding
fixation of cost of each health service or treatment and different
rates may be proposed for different class of private medical
establishments; and

(d) any other functions as may be prescribed by the State
Government.

(2) The State Government on the recommendation of the Expert
Committee fix the rates of each class of treatment and different rates may be
fixed for different class of private medical establishment.

(3) Other ad-hoc Committees .- (a) The State Government may
also constitute such number of ad-hoc committees with such number of
members as may be prescribed,

(b) The ad-hoc committee shall perform such work as may be
prescribed and shall submit its report to the State Government for its
consideration;

(c) The Expert Committee constituted under section 9 or the ad-hoc
committee constituted under sub-section (3) shall follow such procedure as
may be prescribed in discharge of its functions; and

(d) The non-official Members of the Committee shall be eligible for
Travelling Allowance and Daily Allowance or any other allowances as may be
prescribed by the State Government."

11. Amendment of section 10.- In section 10 of the Principal Act,-

(1) in sub-section (1),-

(a) after the words "schedule of charges" occurring in two places
the words "or the rates fixed by the State Government" shall be
inserted; and

(b) after the words "on the notice board" the words "in a
prominent place or reception” shall be inserted.

(ii) in sub-section (2) after the word "charges" the words "fixed
by the State Government" shall be inserted.

(iii) after sub-section (2] the following shall be inserted, namely:-

"(3) Every Private Medical Establishment shall follow the
rates as fixed by the Government and including the package
rates for investigation, bed charges, operation theatre
procedure, intensive care, ventilation, implants,



consultation and similar tests and procedures and any
additional treatments or procedure shall not attract
additional charges over and above such rates fixed by the
State Government including the package rates unless
explained to and consented to by the patient.

(4) Every Private Medical Establishment shall provide
proper estimates for treatments not covered in fixed rates
and charges to the patient or attendant of the patient
during initiation or due course of treatment and final bill
shall not exceed estimates.”

12. Amendment of section 11.- In section 11 of the Principal Act,-

(). in clause (i) after the words, "it at the establishment" the
words "in the event of such emergencies, the Private Medical
Establishment shall provide necessary healthcare to save the
life of the patient without insisting on advance payment" shall
be inserted; and

(ii). after clause (iv) the following shall be inserted, namely:-

" (v]. Every Private Medical Establishment shall display the
Patient’s Charter and Private Medical Establishment's Charter
in such place easily visible to the public; and

(vi) Every Private Medical Establishment shall handover in the
event of the death, the body of the deceased immediately,
without insisting on the payment of the dues. The same may
be recovered from representatives of the diseased in due
course."

13. Insertion of new section 11A.- After section 11 of the Principal
Act, the following shall be inserted, namely:-

"11A. Patients’ Charter and Private Medical Establishment's
Charter.- Every patient or authorised family member and Private
Medical Establishment shall have the rights and duties specified in the
Patient’s and Private Medical Establishment's Charter. Any violations
of the Patient's and Private Medical Establishment's Charter shall be
referred to the Grivenance Redressal Committee constituted under
section 8.

11B. Power of State Government to amend the schedule.- (1) The
State Government may by notification add, amend or omit any of the
entries in the schedule.

(2) Every notification issued by the State Government under this section
shall be laid before both houses of the State Legislature.”

14. Amendment of section 12.- In section 12 of the Principal Act,
after sub-section (2), the following shall be inserted, namely:-



" Provided that no such information shall be disclosed to other
person."

15. Amendment of section 15.- In section 15 of the Principal Act, in
sub-section (1) in the provisio after the words "Private Medical
Establishment” the words "and also arrangements are made within
reasonable time ensuring uninterrupted health care to the inpatients” shall
be inserted.

16. Amendment of section 16.- In section 16 of the Principal Act, ,-
(i) for the words "There shall be an Appellate Authority" the words
"There shall be an Appellate Authority over Registration Authority”
shall be substituted; and
(ii) for clause (c) the following shall be substituted, namely:-
" (c). The Director of AYUSH
(Ayurveda, Yoga and Naturopathy, - Member
Unani, Siddha and Homeopathi)
(d). The Drug Controller, Government
of Karnataka. - Member."

17. Amendment of section 18.- In section 18 of the Principal Act,
the words "whether on payment basis or not" shall be omitted.

18. Amendment of section 19.- In section 19 of the Principal Act,-
(i) in sub-section (1) for the words "ten thousand" the words "five
lakhs" shall be substituted;

(i1) in sub-section (4),-

(a) for the words "six months and with a fine which may extended
to two thousand rupees" the words "three years and with a
fine which may extend to one lakh rupees” shall be
substituted; and

(b) for the words "one year and with a fine which may extended to
five thousand rupees" the words "five years and with a fine
which may extend to five lakhs rupees" shall be substituted.

(1) after sub-section (4) the following shall be inserted,

namely:-

"(4-A) where a person contravenes the provisions of section
10 shall on conviction be punished with imprisonment for a
term which shall not be less than six months but which
may extend upto three years and for a fine which shall be
not less than twenty five thousand rupees but which may
extend upto five lakhs rupees. He shall also be liable for
suspension or cancellation of registration and action under
sub-section (2) and (3)."; and

(iv)  in sub-section (5) for the words "five thousand rupees" the

words " one lakh rupees" shall be substituted.

19. Insertion of schedule.- After section 28 of the Principal Act the

following schedule shall be inserted, namely:-



"SCHEDULE
(see clause (s) of section 2 and section 11B)
Patient's Charter and Establishment Charter

I. PATIENT'S CHARTER (Rights) :
(1) Care.- Every Patient shall have,-

(i)

(iv).

a right to receive treatment irrespective of their type of primary
and associated illnesses, socio-economic status, age, gender,
sexual orientation, religion, caste, cultural preferences, linguistic
and geographical origins or political affiliations;

right to be heard to his satisfaction without the doctor interrupting
before completion of narrating their entire problem and concerns;
expectation from the doctor to write the prescription legibly and
explain to the patient on the details on dosage, dos & don’ts &
generic options for the medicines; and

to be provided with information and access on whom to contact in
case of an emergency.

(2) Confidentiality and Dignity.- Every Patient shall have,-

(i).
(ii).
(ifi).

(iv).

(v).

right to personal dignity and to receive care without any form of
stigma and discrimination,;

privacy during examination and treatment;

protection from physical abuse and neglect;

accommodating and respecting his special needs such as
spiritual and cultural preferences; and

right to confidentiality about their medical condition.

(3) Information.- Every Patient or his authorised family member shall have

right to,-
(i) information to be provided to him which are meant to be and in a
language of
the patient’s preference and in a manner that is effortless to
understand,-

(ii).

(iii).
(iv).

(v).

(vi).
(vii).
(viii).
(ix).

receive complete information on the medical problem, prescription,
treatment and procedure details;

a documented procedure for his informed consent exists to enable
them to make an informed decision about their care to be practiced
with utmost diligence and transparency;

be educated on risks, benefits, expected treatment outcomes and
possible complications to enable them to make informed decisions
and involve them in the care planning and delivery process;

request information on the names, dosages and adverse effects of
the medication that they are treated with;

request access and receive a copy of their clinical records;

complete information on the expected cost of treatment presented
as an itemised structure of the various expenses and charges;
information on hospital rules and regulations; and

information on organ donation.



(4) Preferences.- Every Patient shall have right to,-
(i). seek a second opinion on his medical condition; and
(i)). get the his treatment options, so that the patient can select
what works best for him.
(5) Right to redress.- Every Patient shall have right to,-
(). justice by lodging a complaint through an authority dedicated
for this purpose by the healthcare provider organisation or with
Government health authorities;

(ii). a fair and prompt hearing of his concern; and

(in). appeal to a higher authority in the private medical
establishment and insist in writing on the outcome of the
complaint.

II. PATIENTS’ RESPONSIBILITIES.- Every Patient shall,-
(1) Honesty in Disclosure,- Be honest with the treating Doctor in
disclosing family or medical history
(2) Treatment Compliance.- Evert patient shall,-
(). be punctual for appointments;
(ii). do the best to comply with the doctor’s treatment plan;
(ii1). have realistic expectations from the doctor and his treatment;
(iv). inform and bring to the doctor’s notice if it has been difficult to
understand any part of the treatment or of the existences of
challenges in complying with the treatment; and
(v). display intent to participate intelligently in medical care by actively
involving in the prescribed do-at-home activities.

(3) Intent for Health Promotion.- Every patient shall do everything in
capacity to maintain healthy habits and routines that contribute to good
health and take responsibility for health.

(4) Transparency and Honesty .- Every patient shall,-

(). make a sincere effort to understand therapies which include the
medicines prescribed and their associated adverse effects and other
compliances for effective treatment outcomes;

(ii). not ask for surreptitious bills and false certificates, and/or advocate
forcefully by unlawful means to provide with one;

(iii). in the event of not being happy, will inform and discuss with doctor;
and
(iv). report fraud and wrong-doing.

(5) Conduct.- Every patient shall,-
(i). respect the doctors and medical staff caring and treating;

(ii). abide by the Hospital or facility rules;

(iii). bear the agreed expenses of the treatment that is explained to in
advance and pay bills on time; and

(iv). not involve in abusing, assaulting or causing harm to the Doctor or
staff of Hospital. (any contravention may attract penalty under the
Karnataka Prohibition of Violence Against Medicare Service
Personnel and Damage to Property in Medicare Service Institutions
Act, 2009 (Karnataka Act O1 of 2009))



III. PRIVATE MEDICAL ESTABLISHMENT’S CHARTER

(1) Transparency and Honesty.- Every Private Medical Establishment
shall,-
(i provide a printed schedule of fee for office visits, procedures, testing
and surgery and provide itemized bills; and
(ii) inform patient's qualifications to perform the proposed diagnostic
measures or treatments.

(2) Patient Friendly.- Every Private Medical Establishment shall,-

(i). schedule appointments in such a manner that it may allow patient
the necessary time to interact and examine him with minimal
waiting times and listen to his problems and concerns without
interruptions or distractions; and

(ii). encourage patient to bring a friend or relative into the examining
room with him.

(3) Effective Communication for Patient Education.- Every Doctor
shall,-

(i). explain the patient prognosis, further diagnostic activity and
treatment in simple terms such that it facilitates easy understanding
to him;

(ii). prescribe an Information, Therapy and discuss with the patient
diagnostic treatment and medication options, to enable him to make
well-informed of decisions; and

(ii1). not proceed until the patient is satisfied and convinced that he
understand the benefits and risks of each alternative and he have
his agreement on a particular course of action.

(4) Implement the patient charter.- Every Private Medical
Establishment shall,-
(i). publish the patient charter in Kannada, English and Hindji;
(ii). display the patient charter prominently and at multiple locations in
the healthcare provider setting; and
(iii). implement the patient charter in its true spirit in everyday medical
practice."



10

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

It is considered necessary to amend the Karnataka Private Medical
Establishments Act, 2007 (Karnataka Act 21 of 2007) to,-

(i) constitute the District or Metropolitan Grievance Redressal

Committee for redressal of Grievance of patients;

(ii) empower to the State Government to fix the rates or charges for
each class of treatment to be collected by the Private Medical
Establishments and to notify different rates for different class of Private
Medical Establishments on the recommendation of the Expert Committee;

(iii) if the Private Medical Establishments collect more charges than
that fixed by the State Government, to impose penalty of not less than
Rs.25,000/- which may extend to Rs.5.00 lakhs and imprisonment not less
than six months which may extend upto three years;

(iv) reconstitute the Registration Authority;

(v) specify the Patient's Charter and Private Medical Establishment's
Charter in the Private Medical Establishments in the schedule to the Act;

(vi) not to demand for advance payment from patient or representative

of patient in case of emergency treatment;

(vii) not to demand any due amount at the time of handing over of the

dead body to the concerned person but to collect dues later;
(viii) enhance certain penalties leviable under section 19;and

(ix) certain other amendments incidentals or consequential are also

madge.

Hence the Bill.



11

FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

There is no extra expenditure involved in the proposed Legislative
measure.



12

MEMORANDUM REGARDING DELEGATED LEGISLATION

Clause 7

Sub-section (1) of section 7 sought to be substituted under this
clause empowers the State Government,-

(a) to make rules regarding the manner of granting registration
or rejecting the application within 30 days to the Private
Medical Establishments; and

(b) to make rules regarding the manner of constituting of the
Inspection Committee by the Registration Authority.

Clause 8

Item (v) of Sub-section (4) of section 8 sought to be substituted,
empowers the State Government to make rules regarding any
other matter for investigating by the District or Metropolitan
Grievance Redressal Committee.

Clause 10

Clause 9A sought to be inserted,-

(i) clause (d) of sub-section (1) empowers the State Government
to make rules regarding other functions of the Expert
Committees and other Committees;

(11) sub-clause {3),-

(a) clause (a) empowers the State Government to make rules
regarding the manner of constitution of ad-hoc committees
and specify their number of members;

(b) clause (b) empowers the State Government to make rules
regarding performance of the work of ad-hoc committee and
manner of submitting its report to the State Government;

(c) clause (c) empowers the State Government to make rules
regarding the procedure for discharging of functions of the
Expert's Committee and ad-hoc Committee; and

(d) clause (d) empowers the State Government to make rules
regarding eligibility of Travelling Allowance and Daily
Allowances or other Allowances for non-official members of
the Committees.

The proposed delegation of Legislative power is normal in character

K.R.RAMESH KUMAR
Minister for Health and Family Welfare

S. Murthy
Secretary (I/c)
Karnataka Legislative Assembly




13

ANNEXURE

Extract from the Karnataka Private Medical Establishments Act, 2007
(Karnataka Act 21 of 2007)

XX XX XX
2. Definitions.- In this Act, unless the context otherwise requires,-
XX XX XX

(e) "Department" means the Department of Health and Family Welfare or the
Department of Indiann Systems of Medicine and Homeopathy, Government of
Karnataka, as the case may be;

XX XX XX

(h) “Local Inspection Comrmittee” means Local Inspection Committee constituted
under section 8;

XX XX XX

() “Medical treatment” means systematic diagnosis and treatment for prevention or
cure of any disease, or to improve the condition of health of any person through
allopathic or any other recognised systems of medicine such as Ayurveda,
Unani, Homeopathy, Yoga, [Integrated medicine,} Naturopathy and Siddha; and
includes Acupuncture and Acupressure treatments;

(m) “Nursing Home” means an establishment where persons suffering from illness,
injury or infirmity (whether of body or mind) are usually received or
accommodated or both for the purpose of treatment of diseases or infirmity or
for improvement of health or for the purposes of relaxation or for any other
purpose whatsoever, whether or not analogous to the purposes mentioned in
clause (1) of this section,;

’5‘
N

“Private Medical Establishment” means a hospital or dispensary with beds or
without beds, a Nursing Home, Clinical Laboratory, Diagnostic Centre,
Maternity Home, Blood Bank, Radiological Centre, Scanning Centre,
Physiotherapy Centre, Clinic, Polyclinic, Consultation Centre and such other
establishments by whatever name called where investigation, diagnosis and
preventive or curative or rehabilitative medical treatment facilities are provided
to the public and includes Voluntary or Private Establishments but does not
include Medical Establishments run or maintained or sponsored by,-
XX XX XX

(r) “Registration Authority” means the Registration Authority referred to in
section 4.

XX XX XX

3. Registration of Private Medical Establishments.- On and after the
appointed day, no Private Medical Establishment shall be established, run or
maintained in the State except under and in accordance with the terms and
conditions of registration granted under this Act:

Provided that a Private Medical Establishment in existence immediately prior
to the appointed day shall apply for such registration 2 [within six months from the
date of commencement of the Karnataka Private Medical Establishments
(Amendment) Act, 2012] and pending orders thereon may continue to run or
maintain till the disposal of the application.



14

XX XX XX

4. Registration Authority.- There shall be a Registration Authority in each
district consisting of the following members, namely:-

a | The Deputy Commissioner of the district Chairman
b | District Health and Family Welfare Officer Member Secretary
¢ | President or Secretary, Indian Medical Member
Association of the concerned district
d | District AYUSH officer Member
e | President or Secretary, the AYUSH Federation of | Member
India of the concerned district

XX XX p. 0.4

5. Application for Registration.- (1) Every person desiring to establish,
run, maintain or continue to run and maintain a Private Medical Establishment
shall make an application to the concerned Registration Authority in such form, in
such manner and along with such fees as may be prescribed and different amount
of fees may be prescribed, for different class or classes of Private Medical
Establishments.

XX XX XX

6. Pre-requisites for Registration of Private Medical Establishments.-
The Registration Authority shall before granting the registration consider whether
the following prerequisites for registration of a Private Medical Establishment are
satisfied, namely:-
XX XX XX

(iv) that the Private Medical Establishment conforms to the standards
referred to in section 9;

XX XX XX

7. Disposal of applications.- (1) On receipt of an application under section
5, the Registration Authority may having regard to the provisions of section 6 and
after such enquiry as may be necessary, by Local Inspection Committee, either
grant registration subject to such conditions as may be prescribed or reject the
application: Provided that the Registration Authority shall not reject the application
without giving an opportunity of being heard to the applicant and without recording
the reasons for such rejection.

XX XX XX

(3) Every registration granted under sub-section (1) shall be valid for a period
of five years and may be renewed once in five years on an application made in such
form, in such manner and on payment of such fees, as may be prescribed.

8. Local Inspection Committee.- (1) The Registration Authority of each
district may constitute one or more Local Inspection Committee for each district
consisting of such persons as it may specify for the purposes specified in sub-
sections (1) of section 7 and sub-section (2) of this section.

(2) The Local Inspection Committee, either with prior intimation or on
receiving a complaint, may at reasonable time, inspect, a Private Medical
Establishment to satisfy itself that the provisions of this Act and the rules made
thereunder and the conditions of registration are being duly observed.



15

(3) If any defects or deficiencies are noticed during inspection, the Local
Inspection Committee shall report to the Registration Authority which may direct
the Manager of the Private Medical Establishment to remedy the same within such
reasonable time as may be specified in the order. Thereupon the Manager shall
comply with every such direction and report the compliance to the Registration
Authority within the time so specified. (4) The Manager of the Private Medical
Establishment shall provide all reasonable facilities for such inspection.

XX XX XX

9. Standards.- (1) Every Private Medical Establishment shall conform to the
standards laid down in this Act or the rules made thereunder or any other law for
the time being in force concerning the staff and their qualifications, operation
theatre, buildings, space requirements, equipment, facilities to be provided to the
patients and their attendants, maintenance and other matters.

(2) Different standards may be set for different class or classes of Private
Medical Establishments, in respect of different areas, as determined by the State
Government. Expert Committees may be constituted by the State Government for
suggesting the standards for different class or classes of Private Medical
Establishment for different areas from time to time. The composition, powers and
responsibilities, of the Expert Committees and the terms and conditions of service
of members of the Expert Committee shall be as may be prescribed.

10. Schedule of charges to be notified.- (1) Every Private Medical
Establishment shall for the information of the patients and general public make
available the schedule of charges payable for different medical treatment and other
services, in the form of brochures or booklets and shall also display such schedule
of charges on the notice board of the private Medical Establishment. A copy of such
brochure or booklet shall be sent to the Registration Authority.

(2) No Private Medical Establishment shall cellect from the patient or his
relatives or attendants any amount in excess of the charges printed in the brochure
or booklet, and without issuing proper receipt for the amount charged and
collected.

11. Obligations of Private Medical Establishments.- Every Private Medical
Establishment shall:-

() administer necessary first aid and take other life saving or stabilising
emergency measures in all medico-legal or potentially medico-legal cases such as
victims of road accidents, accidental or induced burns or poisoning or 10 criminal
assaults and the like which present themselves or are brought before it at the
establishment.

XX XX XX

(iv) furnish to the Registration Authority such particulars in respect of such
non-communicable diseases as may be notified by the State Government from time
to time.

12. Maintenance of clinical records.-

XX XX XX

(2) Every clinical record shall be open to inspection, in due discharge of his
duties, by the District Surgeon or any other officer specifically empowered in this
behalf by the State Government.

XX XX XX



Pt
o)}

15. Suspension or cancellation of registration.- (1) The Registration
Authority, on the basis of a complaint or otherwise if a prima facie case exists
about the contravention of any provisions of this Act or the rules made there under
or conditions of registration may, by order in writing and for the reason to be
recorded in writing suspend or cancel the registration of a Private Medical
Establishment:

Provided that no such order shall be made except after giving a reasonable
opportunity of being heard, to the Private Medical Establishment.

16. Appellate Authority.- There shall be an Appellate Authority consisting
of the following members, namely:-

(a) the Commissioner for Health and Family Welfare, Karnataka -Chairman

(b) the Director of Health Services, Karnataka - Member

(c) the Director, Indian System of Medicine and Homeopathy - Member

XX XX XX

18. Private Medical Establishments to report the names of government
doctors on their establishments.- Every Private Medical Establishment shall
report to the State Government and the Registration Authority, the names of
government doctors and para medical staff, whose services are utilized in the
Private Medical Establishment for consultations or any other basis whether on
payment basis or not.

19. Penalties.-

(1) Where any person establishes, runs or maintains a Private Medical
Establishment without registration granted under section 7 he shall, on conviction,
be punished with imprisonment for a term which may extend to three years and
with fine which may extend upto ten thousand rupees.

XX XX XX

(4) Where any person runs or maintains a Private Medical Establishment in
contravention of the conditions of registration or contravenes the provisions of
section 12 or 13, or fails to comply with the direction issued under sub-section (2).
he shall, on conviction, be punished with imprisonment for a term which may
extend to six months and with a fine which may extend to two thousand rupees
and in the case of a second or subsequent offence with imprisonment for a term
which may extend to one year and with a fine which may extend to five thousand
rupees.

(5) Where a person contravenes any other provision of this Act or the rules
made there under he shall, on conviction, be punishable with a fine which may
extend to five thousand rupees.

XX XX XX

28. Repeal and Savings:-

(1) The Karnataka Private Nursing Homes (Regulation) Act, 1976 (Karnataka
Act 75 of 1976) is hereby repealed.

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal,-

(a) anything done or any action taken under the repealed Act shall be
deemed to have been done or taken under the corresponding provisions of this Act;

(b) all applications made under the repealed Act for registration or renewal
prior to the commencement of this Act and pending consideration on the date of
commencement of this Act shall abate 17 and the fee paid, if any, in respect of
such application shall be refunded to the applicant and such applicants may apply
afresh for Registration under the provisions of this Act.

XX XX XX

Government Press, Vikasa Soudha Unit, Bengaluru 12% June, 2017 P7, W.D., Copies 1000



(Provisionally admitted)

KARNATAKA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY
FOURTEENTH LEGISLATIV E ASSEMBLY

FOURTEENTH SESSION

Amendments to the Karnataka Private Medical Establishments

(Amendment) Bill, 2017 (L.A. Bill No. 24 of 2017).

.By Shri K. R. Ramesh Kumar, Minister for Health and Family Welfare

I hereby give notice of my intention to move the following amendments to
the Karnataka Private Medical Establishments (Amendment) Bill, 2017
(L.A. Bill No. 24 of 2017}, namely:-

In the said Bill,-
Clause 8

(1) in clause 8, in section 8 sought to be substituted,-
{(a) for sub-section (1) the following shall be substituted, namely:-

"(1) the District or Metropolitan Grievance Redressal Committee
shall be headed by the Chief Executive Officer of the Zilla Panchayat of
the District and consists of superintendent of Police of the District, one
representative among Private Medical Establishments in the District,
District Surgeon and one Woman representative to be nominated by the

State Government:

Provided that the Metropolitan Grievance Redressal Committee
shall be constituted in the Metropolitan Area declared as such by the

Governor under clause (c) of Article 243P of the constitution.



Provided further that in respect of Metropolitan Area, the
Additional Commissioner/Joint Commissioner of the City Co_fporation
appointed by the State Government by notification shall be the head of

the Grievance Redressal Committee"; and

(b) in sub-section (3) sought to be inserted, for the words, “shall direct
the Registration Authority or” the words “shall inform the Registration
Authority and direct” shall be substituted.

, Clause 11
(2) in clause 11, in section 10 in sub-section (1) sought to be inserted by
sub-clause (i), in item (a) for the word “or” the word “and” shall be
substituted. |
Clause 12

(3) in clause 12, in sub-clause (ii), after clause (vi) sought to be inserted
in section 11 of the Principal Act, the following shall be inserted,

namely:-

“(vii) Provide Grievance redressal mechanism at Private Medical
Establishment level in such manner as may be prescribed.”

Clause 18

(4) in clause 18, for sub-clause (ii)/ (iii) and (iv) and the entries relating
thereto the following shall be substituted, namely:-

“ (ii) in sub-section (4),-

«

(@) for the word and figures
“section 10, 12” shall be substituted;

section 12” the word and figures



_3-

(b) for the words “with a fine which may extend to two thousand
rupees” the words “with a fine which may extend to one lakh rupees”

shall be substituted;

(c) for the words “with a fine which may extend to five thousand
rupees” the words “with a fine which may extend to five lakh rupees”

shall be substituted; and

(iii) in sub-section (5) for the words “ five thousand rupees” the words

“one lakh rupees” shall be substituted.”

Clause 19
(5) in clause (19) in schedule sought to be inserted, under the heading
“ LPATIENT’S CHARTER (Rights)”,-

(a) in item (1), for sub-item (ii) the following shall be substituted,
namely:-

“(ii). right to be heard to his problems and concerns to his
satisfaction”;

(b) in item (5) for sub-item (i) the following shall be substituted,
namely:-

“(i) justice through an authority dedicated for this purpose
by the healthcare provider organization or with Government

health authorities;”

S.MURTHY'
Secretary (I/C)






